
THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF STANISLAUS 
ACTION AGENDA SUMMARY 

DEPT: CEO I OES - Fire Warden G. &6Sw BOARD AGENDA # *B-9 

Urgent AGENDADATE June 3 .  7008 

CEO Concurs with Recomm 415 Vote Required YES NO 

SUBJECT: 

Approval to Ratify Turlock Rural Fire District and Hughson Fire District Ordinances Adopting and Amending the 
2007 California Fire Code 

STAFF RECOMMENDATIONS: 

1. Ratify ordinances passed by Turlock Rural Fire District and Hughson Fire District adopting and amending the 
2007 California Fire Code. 

2. Authorize the Stanislaus County Fire Warden or his designee to file a copy of the findings, with the Building 
Standards Commission as prescribed by Government Code ( 8  17958.7; 5 13 869.7). 

FISCAL IMPACT: 

The proposed ordinances will update the Turlock Rural Fire District and the Hughson Fire District's regulations for 
the enforcement of the State Fire Code and amendments within their jurisdictions of the County. There is no fiscal 
impact associated with this item. 

---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------. 

BOARD ACTION AS FOLLOWS: NO. 2008-385 

1) X Approved as recommended 
2) Denied 
3) Approved as amended 
4) Other: 
MOTION: 

ATTEST: CHRISTINE FERRARO TALLMAN, Clerk 

DF-04-33 
File No. DF-I 2-B-24 



Approval to Ratify Turlock Rural Fire District and Hughson Fire District Ordinances 
Adopting and Amending the 2007 California Fire Code 

Page 2 

DISCUSSION: 

The ordinances, when ratified by the Board of Supervisors, will update the Turlock Rural 
Fire District and Hughson Fire District's regulations for the enforcement of the State Fire 
Code and amendments within their jurisdictions of the County. 

The California Fire Code is the primary code used to regulate and enforce fire safety 
standards in California. Every three years, as part of the California Building Standards 
Code, the State of California amends the International Fire Code and adopts it as the 
California Fire Code. The California Fire Code applies throughout the State 180 days 
after its adoption by the State. (Health and Safety Code f j  17958.) The state most recently 
adopted revisions to the California Fire Code on July 1,2007. The attached ordinances 
update and amend the local fire code in the Turlock Rural Fire District and Hughson Fire 
District to be consistent with the current State Fire Code and amendments for local 
conditions. 

A local jurisdiction, such as a fire protection district, may establish more restrictive 
building standards in their Fire Code than those contained in the State or County Fire 
Code that are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological, to topographical 
conditions. (Health and Safety Code §fj 13 143.5, 17958, 8941.5 (b).) Before making 
changes or modifications to the State Fire Code, the Districts must make findings that the 
changes are necessary due to local climatic, geological or topographical conditions in 
their districts. (fj 17958.7.) Once adopted, the ordinance must be transmitted to the 
County where the ordinance will apply. The Board of Supervisors may ratify, modify, or 
deny an adopted ordinance and transmit its determination to the district within 15 days of 
the determination. After ratification, the county is required to file a copy of the finding 
related to local conditions, together with the modification or change with the California 
Building Standards Commission. 

The ordinances adopted by the Turlock Rural Fire District and Hughson Fire District are 
attached. It is expected that as other districts pass their ordinances they will be brought to 
the Board in a similar fashion. 

POLICY ISSUES: 
The Board should determine if approval of this ordinance supports the Board's priorities 
of a safe community and a healthy community. 

STAFFING: 
There is no staffing impact associated with this request. 



KESBLUTION NO. 2007-3 ' 

An orbinam of the Turiock Rutat Fire Protection District adapting the 20W edrtion of the California 
Fire Code, regulating art3 governing the s;ifquardin_g of fife md prapa-ty from fie and expk&m 
hazards arising from the storage, Mndiingand use ofhazarcious substances, materials and deuices, 
and from c o n b i t i m ~ ~ ~ s ~ 8 . o r . p r ~ ~ o c c u p a n c y  of buildings and premises in the 
Turlock Rurai Fire Pmtedion District providing for the issuance of pennits and wlkdon of fees 
t&r&%; repeatir@x&-mra- ar;dpxfs& such ordinances in conftict therewith. 

The Board of Duecbrs of the T W  Rural Fire Pro&ecWn Ditrict does ordain as follows: 

Section 1- That a cemin docum?& one (I) copy of wbich is on file in the office of the Stmislats 
County Fire Pfvgntim Bureau, being marked and designated as the CaCifbrnia Fire Code, 207 
edition, including Appendix Ckipkrs t an64 Appendices A, B, C, 4 E, F, and G as pihkkd by& 
hternationaf Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the T u r W  Rural Fire 
Department, in the SBte of C2lEa~iarequfating and governing the safquding  oflife and property 
b m  fire and explosion hazards arising fmrn the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, 
materials a n c & W i ~ . a c r d . k o r n ~ n s  hazardous to life or -in the occupancy of buildings 
and premises as herein p f o u w  m i d  jnn for the hance o# o f i t  and cdledions of fees 
therefore; and eaeh-Wdieiibre- previsions. penal- CORM- miems ofsaid Fit 
Code on Wein the offie-~f the TurSock Rural Department are hereby referred tu. adopted, and 
made part hereof, as if fully  din^ witt, the add- i m d b n s ,  deletions and 
changes, if any, preswi bed in Section 2 of this ordinance. - - 

S e c t b  2. That the Wlowi- of.-.--? ar% b e b y  revised: 

!Section 3 01.3. Ti& These regt&akms aaH be knolwn as the Fire Cw%e of €he Tudock Rural 
Fire Protection herckrrtferted to as "this code." 

i Section 3 09.3. Vtalation Penalties. Persons dko shall violate a gmv is~ tm of this cafe shall 
fail to c o r n ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ e n k ~ e a k o r  whas!W.erect, install, atter, repair or 
do any work in violation of the approved canstruction docurnents,or dire~tive of the f ~ e  code 
offiaai, arcrfrapanIt of pmbsbes d &of fbis; shall be guilty of a 
misdemeanor, punishable by a fine and imprisonment Each day that a violation continues 
after due-ncxtk~~tra ;m s e t v ~ - ~  &amed a 7 

Section 114.4. Failure to Camp@. Any person who shall continue to work after having 
been s e ~ ~ s t o Q ~ o r R - ~  exceptsuch work as that persun is directed toperform 30 
remove a uidabn. or urisafe condition, shall be Nab to a fine mt less than $500 ddiars or 
more than 1,000 m., 

Section 3- That the g- . .- 
- mdto in& sediorrs of the 2007 California Fire Code 

are hereby established as fdlows: - - 

S e a n  3ZRZtrtr AIlR-t,. SZ, a n d ; E C ~ ~ ~ 6 ~ t i f i d  bjr Titte 30 of the 
T u r i e  Rural FZire Protection District. 

S- ~~mz9:st: mKt4 s - 9 m i n g - d -  mtifi9b- riffe 10 of 
the Turiock Rural Fire Protection District. - - 

Section 3406.2:414' AHC-T, :R-Z; and R-Sroning designations as Identified 6y Title 10 of the 
Turbck Rural Fire Protection D-istrict. 

Section 3804.2 T k " W T t t i W  RUIA # i s m  



Jdll 3U W O  I L . W Y C )  F) L 

TURLOCK I%WRAL FLRE l?RQT-WWOWDISTWCT 

Section 4. That all other o- r e s d u k m  er parts of mlinmeeand es&tio~s irr emfM 
herewith are hereby repealed- - 
Section 5. That if any section, suhctr'sn, sentence, clause or phrase of this adhameis, fo rmy  
reason, held to be unconstitutional; such decision sbU not afkd the vatidity of the remaining portions 
ofthis ordinance: T k B o a r d ~ ~ h e r e b y  declares that it woufd have passed this ordinance, 
and ead, @on, subsection, c lam or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or mote 
section, subsections, sentem ctauzzcanb ph- be declarred uncanstitutional, 

Section 6. That nothing in this ordinam ot in the Fire Code hereby adopted shall be construed to 
m a n y  suit orpioc~eolngimpertdiqin any court; or any rights acquired, or liabiitb, incurred* crr 
any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or adhsnce hereby repealed aS 

S e c t t r n - W t h k ~  mr-sha&an)tjttst or legal ngtrtormnedy &any c k m c k r * - W -  
tmpaired or affected by this ordinance. 

Seetion 7. That the TurlocR UurarFue Deparb-nenf is hereby ordered and directed to.cause 
arcfinance to be published. 

Sedion 8. That this or&nloce and €he ~ l e s ,  regulation, provisions, requirements, orbersand 
matters established and adopted hereby sbalf take effect and k in full force and effect ON JANUARY 
1,2008, from and afterthP-narPotikfbal p a s s a g ~ ~ p t i o n ~  

I 
! 

The foregoing resolution was introduced as a regular meetiw ofthe Turbdc Rura) Fire Protection 
District Board o - w w U ,  2007.. --br J, YV4key 1110- M 
the resolution be adopted and was duly seconded by Board Member 8. Rie* The vote was called for 
and the r e s o f u F w U l e . - -  

AYES: Board Members; Chairman B, Genzdi 
J -Mhb,ey 
R. Macedo 
.L EbjgIes 
B. R b  

NOES: 

ABSENT 

ATTEST: Steven VJilliams, S d r  

N o n e ,  



01/31/2008 THL: 15:03 FAX l e j U 0 3 ; U l Z  

Findings and Adoption of the 2007 Californta Fire Code 

The Board of Supervisors hereby finds and determines: That the International Code Council 1s a 
private organrzaken, uuhiGh hasbeen in existence for at least three (3) years. That the ~allfosnb 
Fire Code, 2007 Edition, and 2007 California Fire Code Standards, published by said organlzatron, 
are nationally rec[~grriz@ld mpi la t ion  sf proposcd rules, regulations, and standards of said 
organltation That said 2007 California Fire Code and Ftre Code Standards have been printed and 
pubhshed 3s am* irrimcMurm-with~n the meaning of Sectton 50022.2 et seq, of the 
Government Code. Tha! one (1) copy of the 2007 California Fire Code and one (1) copy of the 
Intefnational Fke-€&&&ads, cdi f ted bytke€&k to be tr~e copies. have been filed for use 
and exarnrnafion by the puMic in the office of the Clerk. That !he sect~ons of sa~d 2007 Californra - 
Fire C d e  and CalifornlaFire Cde Standardsmag be referred to by the numbw used in said 
plrbllshed compilation. preceded by the wmds "Cairfomta Fre Code Section," "Fire Code Section:- 
or "Calrfornla Fire Code Section" and may also be referred to by additional reference to Munrcipak 
Code and sectlons therein periaining to sard 2097 California Fim Code and +ire Code Sizinck~65 
That the additional requrrements and standards established herein are needed to property protect 
the health, safety, and welf&.tket>rtsting and future r s & t s  and workers of the T u r l d  Rural 
Fire Protection Dtstrtct. Said requirements and standards are reasonably necessary because of 
local climatic, g e o t o g i ~ . a a d . ~ c a l  conditions, and ~ ~ p i y u i i t h e x i s k ~ t e  and 
regulations. 
Amendment of the 2OOT ChLkmiaFie Code is necesswy so a s d o  pfcwrde more stringent 
standards for fire extinguishing systems, f~re hazard and hazardous materials controls IS necessary 
to serve the public interesttryreductng;thertsktar$tifezd-pmpe~. of mcr cdizens of 'Turhk Rural 
Ftre Protection Distnct because of the fdlowlng local condrtions. - - 
(a) Summer weather c o ~ s ~ ~ e r y . d q r ,  h6t? and-wi&y-causrng.m&nary combustibles to be 
oas~ly ignited end fires to be fast spreading: - 

(b) Very dense fog candition~occwrn Wer-. Reduced-uishrkty causes delays in fire response; 
(G) Fire response IS delayed by railroad tracks THEREFORE, for theabove reasons taken 
ind~vidually and curnut&*-ard.in.wdme-wih-the authority-granted in Sectlons 179585 and 
17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code. the Counc~l of the Turlock Rura! Fire P~otection 
District expressly findsiheFe-afek& chahc-Wtopbgrapkil drtbrrs lhat W a  the 
increased fire protectton requirements set forth in this article reasonably necessary. 

Appeals 

Sectton 108.1 of the 20WCaliforn-eke-C*,- WCx Chapiw- I - Administration is hereby 
amended to read as follows- 
Applicant may appeal thedecision 6-the.Ghie5b -the Turlock Rurd Fire PIotection Distrd w i t h  
thirty (30) days from the date of the decision being-eppealed whenever the Chief* 
1. Disapproves an a p p ~ - f ~ ~ ~ ~ t e c ~ a t s . m ; ; 1 t e r i a I s ,  methods andor types of constnrciion. 
2. Disapproves an application for permit or refuses to grant a permit applied for, 
3. When it is claimed that . the .proviWdAb~&d0.~0t  apply. w. 
4. That the true intent and meaning of the code have been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted 



Section 109.22 of the 2007 Cal~fornia Ftre Code Append~x Chaptor I - Admtnistration 1s hereby 
amended to read as fob= 
Criminal Violations. It stsatt beunla\hrfi for any person Cs violate any provisron or to far1 to compiy 
wl!h any of the requirements of this chapter. A violaiicrn of any of the provisions or failing to comply 
with any of the mandatory requirements of this d m p k r s h d  ccnstttute a rn~sdemar~,  ex-t h4 
notwithstanding any other provision of thts code, any such violation constituting a mrsdemeanor 
t~nder this code may, in the disctetion of the Turtock Rurzt F~re Protection District Atiorney, be 
charge@ and prosecuted as an-rnfract~~n. Any perscin convicted of a mjsdemcanor under the 
pr~visions of this chaptar, unlW provistoa rs otherwise herein made, shell be pun~shable by a fine 
cf not more than one thousend doflars ($1,000 00) or by imprisonment h the county jail for a 
period of not more than six-(6frnantt.rsorwtmttrfine and imprisorrrne~rt;ktry person convicted af 
an infraction uoder the pravisrons of this code. unless provision is otherwise herein made, shag be 
panshabtcrby awe mly asf&ws,.Vpoa.afiisf conviction, by a Om ufmt exceeding two 
hundre$ filly dollars ($250.00) and for a second conviction or any subsequent conv~ction within a 
period of one year. b y - a A n a o f ~ n g f i v s h u n d r e 8  doUaFs ($5W.00). 
Each such person shall be charged with a separate offense for each and every day during any 
portion of whiek anptmktm of m y  p m k m m F h s c O d e i S c c ~ ~ ~  continued or permitted by 
suck person and shaii, upon convidion, be punished accordingiy. 

Administrative Pen- 
\ 

In addition to any other remediesMfodh-in this ckapte~, administrative penalties may bs imposed 
against any person, as defined In Secticm 109.3 of this Code, for violating any of the requirements 
set forth in this chaptar. A n y , a d i n i ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ s s e d ~ a l t  beas follows; 
(a) For violations of this Code, Possession, Sale. Use or Discharge of Dangerow Fireworks, the 
adrntnistrative psnalty shatthefiue htmdieddottars.(~0;OD) fa-e&x.spec%K:actfournl to be m 
violation of that section. 
(b) For all violations ~ k t ; ~ E ~ ~ % , . ~ u s  Fireworks, 
the amount of the administrative penalty shall be one hundred dollars ($100.0Q)for the first 
violation, twoStuReh& deHm ($20$.QO) for asetandrvMmMin-arry.tw&e (1 2) month period 
and fwe hundred dollars ($500 00) for any subsequent violatior\s within any twelve (12) month - 
period. 

Permit Required for-Cw#ahQpwdkms 

2007 CJhfornia Fim Code Appendix Chapter 1- ~drhinistration is here by amended to read as 
follows: 
Sections IQ5-6-15. 105.6-19, and 105.6.30 are hereby deleted. 

Fees 

(a)Permi t Fee. The Board-of-tkTwlock-R)~eC-FkePr~t'ien- Diskic~rnay, by resduiim adq&d 
from time to time, a fee for any permit issued pursuant to the Fire Code- 
(b) Plan Check Fee. W h e n ~ k r ~ u e d - t o  be submittedthe pbn-checlcim fesshdl be paid at 
the time of submitting plans and specifications for checking. 
Where plans are incamplete,.or-ch~e8so.as-tore$uire an additional plan c h ~ k ;  an additional 



01 /31 , '2008  THkl 15:05 FAX @005/012 

ptan-check fae shafi be c h x g d a i a r a t e  shown in a schedule setting fotih fees as ado~ted from 
time to time by resolution of the Tiiilock Ri~rai Fire Protection District. 

Water Supplies and Fire Hydrants 

Section 508 5.1 of ihe 2007 California Fre Cod6 is hereby amended to read as foiiows: 
Required Water Supply far fire- protection. An appraved water supply capabie of supplying the 
required f~ re  flow for fire ptecttcm$!hatbkpvided tcqmrnaes umn which facilities, buildings or 
portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurrsdlction. When any 
portion of the fxilify or buikiing protected-is in excess of ?#feet (45 720 mm) from a water supply 
on a public street, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the faculty or building, 
on-site fire hydrants and mains cap&kof supplying the r q u h d  fire flow shall b e  provided when 
required by the chief. 
Fire hydrants shdl be located on the supply side of the fire suppression system check valve. 
Fire hydrants shall be accessibteweFrfe-Department apparatus Oy W s  meeting the 
requirements of Section 503.1. - 

Fire Extinguishing Systems Chapter 9 is amended as foliovvs 

903.2.1 -1 (A- 1 0 c c u p a ~ e n d ; a s f o ~ ~  

1. The building exceeds 5.000 square feet (465 m2). 

903.2.1.2 (A-2 Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

I .  The Wilding e x M ( 1 0 0 - s q u a r e  feet (465 m?. 

903.2.1.3 (A-3 Occupancy) Amend as follows; 

1. The building e x u ~ x W i , W w a r e f & ( 4 6 5  m2}. 
I 

903.2.1.4 (A-4 Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

1. The building cxceeds6,Wqere$et (465 m2}. 

903.2.2 (E Occupancy) Amend as follows: - - -  

1. The building exceeds 5.000 ~ - f e e l  (465-d). 

903.2.3 (F-1 Occupancy) Amend as follows: - 

1. The building excasdr&OWsquarefeel(465 m2}. 
-. 

903.2.6 (M Occupancy) Arnwtd as,hlbw%, 

1. The building exceeds 5.000 square feet (465 m2). 

1. The building exceeds 5.000 square feet (465 m2). 

2. Ail residential structures containing 5 or more dwelling units under a single roof. 

5 



.(liuol Japun eaJe 
~ool) leloi) la* a~enbs (000's) puesrlvyl ah[) Gurpaa~xa alnpnqs JU bu!pl!nq pies u1 lpsat  q q q ~  

~o (pw npurt wrc? wj lqq) laq ajenbs (0(333-)q%wenr0y~wg3pem leql ajn13n1~s JO 6u!pl!nq 
0u!ls!xa ue p (m!e~d& alepa pal parpa3 E Aq pmiwmlap uo!lenlm JU uagenph passasse 
Xjum3 lua~jn3) anleh jep) ayap ~ua~~&(~~;)-rC~ypaa3xaptlipo!~ad q1~row-anjam Aue u ! q l ! ~  

apeui ale sl!edal lo 'suot~e~ajle 'suo!l!ppe uaqmseJnpn~)s pue s6u!pi!nq Gu!gs!xa Ile ur pa1jepu! aq 
I F ~ S  U J ~ M S J W P J ~ ~ U I ~ I =  wutj-.f--qp~!na ~ U ! I S ! X ~  13 L-Z'CO~ 

{v)dzo.oz- rz 
uo113a~ apoa Alum=) sne1que)S Japun juauryedaa 6u!uueld ay) Aq pa~tur~ad pue sauoz 

iemtn3tm u! pi-i a= I ~ Y I  -~n~n;rts p ; ? d ~ o i p m m ~ ~ f s a f - ~ ~ ~  - L 
:NOlld33X3 

aL -tpwm=# ~ ~ - w o ! s - V = ~ Q  ~ u ! P I ! ~  all 1 - 1 

'Meq3 s!qi A$ p + r t 6 a J  uaqM slalyu!lds 
a q  aye~uolne q v ~  papthQid aq ijeqsh piie 6 u ! i l a ~ p  ay] se 4001 awes sql =pun parap!suor, 

aq ipkp fiu!lia~p ayl y$!.Fn 3!g]e 30 pol 'jlern uewwo3 auo jseafle.csrc?qs ley) saSe~e3 
4001 9vo lapun sa~eds  pasc11m3 iaq:o ge pup sa6e?e6 apn;2ui ijsys sa~r\,;=tn~;s ayi ;o 

a6ejoo~ alenbs eql 'nat3r~edw3o g-y SE palpep seJnpnJls pue s6u!pl!nq log 'c 



a l J ~ p a ~ l f l b C 3 ~  a6e~ols 
aql ptmAaq sa)nuluj 0~ ~ ~ i ~ a p p p e  ue 'o) puetuep asoq pue ~alyu!~ds alepotuuro~~e 01 

paptmrd aq Iptls+#!cpaqlat qqejdegw e w 9  dam mq1o.~.?pq-&e~0)8 ;f)8~sdas g 

M & q s t e  mj pa~!nbal yuq 
40 az!s len)~e-aqi au!wJalap oi pap!~o~d aq jjeqs suo!lelnqe=) puetuap i a l ~ ~ d s  pa@p31m 

ail8 u e t l ~ f i - ~ ~ ~ ~ 1 ~ d ~ ? m e g 7 s n u t ~ y t r e l m l % ~ - a ~  JOJ Atddns 
qlsewop pue Alddns aly a 4  y p q  m a s  Asw pue dwnd tlaM qlwwop ayl Ay paq~nssald 

aq Aew quel ay_t'sapiu!w*~t-Jo wpelnp w r r u n v r m ~ - m ~ y m q ~ u m e u d  clipAq e Aq 
pap!~old aq ~leqs-@~ue~olje LueaJis asoy Gurpfipu! IOU) puewap rqyuuds pa~!nba~ aql 'Z 

.c 1 
plepuels uo!le!3osst/ uo113alo~d al!j leuo!leN JQ epo3 ~ J I  j e!ujq!le3 aqa A q  'suo!ien)!s 

lepads raqlo lo '9Sn 'UO!)3nJ]SUO3 JO adAj 01 anp ' ( s ) q p p e  .ayl-ux)qpejl!uo 
eq q paU!wlad a E  s~alyqjds pue %a~nt~nqs 10 *u!pl!nq e q  40 ( s ) u a ~ a ~ w ~ d ~ !  

J O ~  uo!lenleA passasse Alunor, 1ualln3) anpn aq] jo ~ u a s t e d - ( ~ ~ )  Qg u e y ~  ssal 
s! (s)samimqs JO (s)fSu!pl!llq-fju!l~!xa eql jo lapowel e q  jo ~ s m  a q  uuaq~ s~aiyu!~ds 

qewo)ne ujorj lduaxa em (s)us!~!pge $3~1  pue %~mnrfsxr~u!pi !nq 6u!ts!xa .p 

-pal areilbs (000's) puesnoyl ahi) paac~xa lou saop uo!pod q e e  uayM 'apo3 Gu!pl!ng 
aq p uoippa paldope iuaun=r aql q j ! ~  e3uea~sme u! pa~sn-~~sws ' s j l e ~  uo!le~edas 

eale aiow NJ, QUO Aq paje~edas amjmlls JO Gqppnq S U ~ S ! X ~  ue 40 uuo!ljod q3e3 -E 

(tl)dio.oz- r z 
uo!pag epo3 Ajuno3 snels!ueiS lapun ]~atul~??cla~ 6u!Weld a41 A q  pall!uljad 

pua m s z  pnj lnc?!d5~  ul pqe301 ajs s a n p t n s  pus$$gpltnq le!guap!sat-uo~ 



C11'31 /ZOO8 THIl 1 5 :  0 6  FAX 

Open burning. No person-shah kindle,-conduct, or maintain any twrntng of grass, weeds 
agrietdtiiial trimmiiigs, Gr 6 t h ~  ~0mt i t i~ t~bL6~ or atfthorlze any suci~ fire to be klrldled, conducted, or 
maintained wlthouf a pernl~t as r + W - b y  th&m Joaguin Valley Enifled Air Poliutton ~ontrnl 
Dlstric: and c~rnpriarlce wriii ail safeguards pursuant itiereto Any such permitted burning shall be 
restricted to agricultural p u r p a e s d  mfined-tszseas of the T u r k  k Rurai Fire Protection 
District in which agr~cultural uses are lawful 

Type of bock or Latch for Premiscs Where Gold or Bullion is Traded (NOTE: BviIding EDCW 

Section 1008.1 of the 2007 M m i a - f i f e  Code is amended to add subsection 10 as fofbws: 
Special Latching Devices An exit door from a business wh~ch has as tts primary commercial 
activity the sale, resale, exchanqe a. trade of gold or silver coin, b d t ~ ~ .  m rwtalaz may be 
equipped wilh a locking wechanism which is not able open from ~nside without the-use of a key or 
which requires special knowLe@e.or effort so long as all of the foliowing condrtians are met during 
all t~rnes that the business is open to the public: -. 
1 The locking m e c h m r m & o m ~ t o  a smoke detector system in suchamanner that 
activation or malfunction of the smoke detector system results In 3~lfo1~13ftc;llly unlocking the exit 
door; 
2. The locking mecharusrn-~~~~~~~Bd. to - the&tr ica~  power supply-for thebuilding in such a 
manner that ai;y loss of electrical power to the bullding results in automatically unlock~ng the exit 
door; 
3. Two (2) employees ~nuSthaubn.fh~areaof.  the prerniseswedfw-retaii purposes, including 
adjacent service and utility rooms. at all tlmes; and 
4. A sign is permanently w - t h e p - s s s t o - b e . r & i y  seeabyany p e s w  or 
persons entering the business stat~ng that the management electronically contfolsingress and 

egrf ss. 

False Alarms 

Section 405.?O of the 2007CZdifo~aiaK~eWis hereby amended to read as fdfows: 
False alarms sharl not be grven, signaled or transmitted or caused or permrtted to be  given. 
signaled or transmitbad. -The .Turtoclc-Bur.al.Fife .Protection District may adopt by resolution 
reasonable fees terecuver the costs associated with responses to burlding or structures that have 
excessive false atmrps. 

I 
Hot Works 

Section 2604.2.6 of tI7E.-7- JXtfm%a.E3ue.Chdeis hereby amended. W d  thefdiowing: 
When r-uued by the Chief a minimum 2-A: 208: C-rated fire extinguisher shall be mounted to 
each portable welding cart. 

Firewarks 

See Stanislaus County Code Chapter 9-84 Fireworks 

Restricted Locat---m3tiWwds in Tanks- 
\ 

Seclion_3404.29.5.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as bllows: 
Storage of Class I and l i  tiquidsin abweg~otrnd tmkaouts& of buiklings is prohibited, wilh Ihe 
exception of protected tanks designed, installed ancl mair~lairjed irr  accordance with the 2007 



California Fire Code. Tine pmvislsnsaf.this -sxiion simi rlut apply,ka facilities for-tk-production, 
generatien, 6: transmission ~f elECtiic energji fhai provide power to entities furnishing retail 
electrical services lo b e  gwteraCpcrblic within the Turtmk Rurai Fire Protection District. 

Operating Heating, Lighting, and Cooking Appliances Prohibited 

Sectton 3405 3 3 of the 2OW. Ca(80roa Fire Code is hereby amended 40 rnclu& the f-irtg: 
Class ti and 111 LI~ulds 

Location sf BuS6tP%&-~f&Storsqo uf Rammahie an-uaWtiquibs 

Section 3406.4 of the 2007 Califomla Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
The constructton of new b d k p l a n t s h  storage of flamrnabie or combustible liquids is restricted to 
areas of the Turl~ck Rtirai Fire Protection District zoned Heavy Industrial Zones. All existing 
nonconforming butk p t a r r t s f w m  & f k i m n t a e . ~ m b u s t i b l a  liquids, which sribstantialiy 
comply with the requirements of this Code, may be continued in use ~f the Chi8f grants a perrn~t. 

Transfer Operatkm~*- - 

Section 3406.5.1 1 of the 2007 Cal~fornla Fire Code is hereby amended by adding to the following: 
Tank vehictes and tank c a r s s k d . h e a ~ a s - s ~ o n . a s  p w b l e  after.xriuaL at poirdd ddivery 
and shall not be used as storage tanks. Unless oiherwise approved, a tank car shall not be 
allowed to rsrnah on a ~ ~ ~ ~ n n i ~ t . O f ~ v a ~ y - f o r - r n ~ r : e  than.tWy-four-(24)haurs w h k  
connected for transfer operations. 7 - 

Hazardous MaferhkPennitq 

Subsection 3 is added to Section 2701.5 of Ule 2007 California Fire Cde: 
Key Box. When required by.thd%W,:an approved- k e y  box, sized to contain emergency 
information, shall be provided. 

Deposits of #ar;rrdauaRB=itirrhk; .(=tiranrrp. Abaiornont, ~ E M i t ~  Requite6 
Liability fur Costs - - 

Sectron 2703.3- t &of the2ncrrCalift)rnizEire.Cosla is hereby ammdd-ta read as follows; 
Responsibility for cleanup The person, firm or corporation responsible for an unauthw~ed 
discharge shaii institute andampFetegd.ackonsInee%seary to remedy the effects of such 
unauthorized discharge, whether sudden or gradual. at no cost to lhe jurisdiction. When deemed 
necessary by the Chief, c t e ~ - b e - . r r r i t ~ a ~ ~ F ~ r e  Depmlrnent or by an authorized 
~ndividuaf or  firm. Costs associated with such cleanup shaii be boin by _the owner. operator or other 
person responsibtew ttre,unauthor~zeddis~.-meramedy-prouwd by fils sec4ton shaii k tfi 
addition to any other remedies provtded by law. 
For purposes of t h s s e c t i a n , . c o s f ~ e d - b y  the J u r k k  Rw&F~emoteotron D~str~ct shali include, 
but shall not necessarily be I~mded to, the following- actual labar costs of Turlock Rural Fire 
Protection Distnct p ~ r s 6 n r s & . ~ ~ e c ' s ~ m p e n s a t i o n - b e R ~ t s ; f r r n g e  Wfiits, administrative 
overhead; cost of equipment operation; cost of mater~als obtained directly by the Tudw;k Rural F~re 
Protection D~strict; an& cost&arryamtmct-bbm&n~atenats. The authority trr recover costs under 
thls section shali not include actual fire suppression services that are normally of usually provlded by 



01,'31/2008 THU 1 5 ;  06 FAX 

Ihc Fire Department. 

General Safety Prec- 
Secttan 312.2 of the 2007 Caltfornra Fire Code  is hereby amended to read as follows. 
Protection from vehictes: Guard posts or other approved means shall be provided ro protect 
storage tanks and connected piping, vzives aiid fittings; dispens~ng areas. and use areas sutyect 
to veh~cutar dam* YVRea-quard .@s are k t - .  t ilo-posts shali be: 
1 .  Cofistructed of steel not less than six (6 )  inches in dtarneter and concrete filled, 
2. Spac&notrnace.thmfou~ (@feet hetween p&~.meea&t ,  
3.  Set not less than three (3) feet deep in a concrete footing of not less than a f~fteen (15) inch 
diam~ter,  
4. Set wifh the top of the pastsa&kssthan three (3) feel above ground, and 
5 Located not less than f~ve (5) feet from the lank 

Outside Storage and Use of Liquefied Petroleum Gases 

Section 3804.2 of the 2007 California Eire Code is amended as follows: 
The outside storage o f l i q u k d p B t r ~  gas (LP-gas) shali conform to the provisions oi 
Stanislaus County zoning ordinances. The outside storage snd use of liquefied petroleum gases is 
restricted as specified& T 
1. Storage and dtspensir~y of LP-gas for resale purposes, into approved containers and vehicles. IS 

restricted to lhose areas of-the Srmslaus C2wntyzmed.a~ Corrtmc&Light-indu&~al, Heavy 
Industrial, and, in addition thereto, to other cummerctaliy zoned properties used =automotive 
servrce -stations. Only cpidified pecs.msshaU .pesfcm dtspensing, 
2. Dispensing of LP-gas for private use IS restricted to those zone& identrfied in subsection 1, and 
when approved by the Chief,.maybepermitted in thcs&xeas of h e  StanislausCwnfy zoned 
General Commercial. Only qualified persons shall perform dispensing. 
3. For cooking, lightin~l,ocheaf@$ns hiding,-only on a property that does not have natural gas 
se~tce existing on a boundary line of said property or when prahibition of such storage would 
cause undue haxi&&, 
4. For t e m p o r a r y ~ ~ . s i t e s ,  .whe~z arjthorized by thQX=h* 
5 For use as an alternative h~ei supply for an emergency standby generator, when authorzed by 
the Chief. 
6. Fnr use with certain mobrle vending and certain commetc~al barbecue equipment and other 
specific uses when authocized bythe Chef. 
7. For use by Artisans in pursuif trftheir trade, when authorized by the Chtef. 
8. Storage of portable containers awaiting exchange may b e  permrtted in con~n~ercially ~oned 
areas of the Stanistaus Caunty, indudingtbse tt3md'Neigtibortmod Commercial, when approved 
by the Chief and stored in accordance wifh Section 3809.-Such storage shall be located a 
rn inimum of hhrenly Cu)) feet - fmsny fd dcspemer 
9. Containers that exceed 2,000 gallons shall comply with procedure FPB 82-01 

Permits and P ~ ~ f t Y r ' L i ~ ~ t F W t b l & W i  C%sus - .  

Section 3807.2 of the 2007 GaCifoFniaFtre*is-hbyamcfedtbread-as fottows: 
Permits. Permits shall be required as set forth in Appendix Chapter?, Sections 105.6 and 105.7- 
EX€ EPTION: 

1. Containers not meedi i  5ve GaHon water capacity. used for "barbecue" cooking. 
when used and stored outside of buildings. 
2. Approved cont%nets mtzxceeding sixken and fmr-k=nths{%.4) -015~s e n  
displayed for sale-in mercantile occupancies, - 



3. Factory installed cont&nws-for- recreation&-vehicles not exceedng !en (10) yaUo!: water 
capacity. . . 

4. Factory installed tanks that are perrnar&y attached to rmmMmi vehkles. 
Distiibiitixs sbll riot fill an LP-gas coritainer for which a permit Is required unless the fire code 
official has issued a permit ~ U F  InstaHatlon for that lacation. 

Sup~wlsion and Cornmunicatlon System 
Section 907 2 1.4 of the 20071mniaETre Code IS hereby added to read as follows; 
Supswision. Places of assembly shall b e  under the constant supervision of a competent adlllt on 
the premises during the timethat the prernrses are open to lhe piiblrc C ~ a m u n i c ~ o n s .  When 
required by the chief, places of assembly shall be provided with a method for notifying the fire 
department in the event of an emergency Such method can consist of a telephone, an alarm 
system connected to the fire department or tther approved agency. or other approved means. 
Methods of not~fying H t e - f i m . ~ e n t ~ ; i t l  dcgortment shall be readily avatlabfe to the public. 

Powered Industrial Truck Operation 
Sed~on 309.7 of the 2 0 0 7 ~ f o F n a F h C b c k i s  kerebyan&d.to .read- as follows: Powed 
industrial trucks shall be listed and labeled for use in the environment ~ntendeb and shall be in 
accordance with natlonat)y-wognijzed st-, 

Maintenance of Protected Aboveground Tanks 
Sectton 3404.2.7-3.5.4 &.the aM7; CX~fornia fire Code is herebyi'xided to read as fo4uws: 

Protected aboveground tanks and connected piping shall be maintained in a safe operat~ng 
conditron. Protected abovegecwd tanks shdt b;e.maintaned In 8ccwbnw with their iistrngs. 
Damage to protected aboveground tanks shall be repaired using rnaterrai having equal or greater 
strength and fire reststamartha. ~ & ~ o u . ~  tank shatl bereplac& or taken nut af 

- .  
servce. 



Fire Apparatus Access Roads (Appendix D) 
Appendix D Tabie 01  03.4 is-amended as - f o i i ~  

1 20 -1- ' %  None Required 
I 

0-150 I 

Requirements for Dead-End Fire Apparatus Access Roads 

1 151-500 
I I 

1 20 I 100-fo~t hammerhead or 1 00 foot cul-de-sac I 

I - ~ e n ~ t h  

I -. 

501-750 1 26 / 100-fool hammerh&d'br 1 00 foot .wl-desk -- Width. I 

I Over 750 
I 1 .  

1 Speoal Approval ~ebuired 1 
Appendix D Figure D103-1 is amended as follows: 

Dead-bd Fire Apparatus Access Road Turnaround 

I I 

MINIMUM CLEARANCE 
AROUrn-AEtRE . 

' * HYDRafJI 

/ (feet) 

i nur DIAMETER 
CUL-=-SAC 

Turnarounds Required 
(feet) 

ACCEPTABLE ALTERNATIVE 
TO 7~3' HAlVINERHEAD - 

I 



KUGHSON FIRE PROTECTXON DISTRICT 

ORDINANCE NO. 2008-1 

ORDINANCE FOR ADOPTION OF 
THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

AND PROVIDING FOR THE MODIFICATION THEREOF 

An ordinance of the Hughson Fire Protection District adopting the 2007 edition of the California 
Fire Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of iife and property from fire and explosion 
hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and 
devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and 
premises in the Hughson Fire Protection District; providing for the issuance of permits and 
collection of fees therefore; and repealing Ordinance No. 2 of the Hughson Fire Protection District 
and all other District ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith. 

The Board of Commissioners of the Hughson Fire Protection District does ordain as follows: 

Section 1. That a certain document, one (1) copy of which is on file in the office of the Hughson 
Fire Protection D ' i c t ,  being marked and designated as the California Fire Code, 2007 edition, 
including Appenda Chapters 1 and 4, Appendices A, B, C, Dl El F, G, and H as published by the 
International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of Me Hughson Fire 
Protection District, in the State of California regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and 
property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous 
substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the 
occupancy of buildings and premises as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and 
collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, condlons 
and terms of said Fire Code on file in the office of the Hughson Fire Protection Ditrict are hereby 
referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the 
additions, insertion, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance. 

Section 2. That the following sections of Appendix Chapter 1 are hereby revised: 

Section 101 .I Tile These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the Hughson 
Fire Protection District, hereinafter referred to as "this code." 

Section 109.3. Violation Penattiis. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code, 
shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, 
repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the 
fire code official, or of a permit of certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be 
guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than $1,000 dollars or by 
imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that 
a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate 
offense. 

Section 114.4 Failure to Comply Any person who shall continue any work after having 
been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to 
perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less that 
$500 dollars or more than $1,000 dollars. 

Seetion 3. That the Findings and Adoption of Me 2007 California Fire Code, which is attached 
hereto is incorporated by this reference. 



Section 3204.3.1 .I All R-I, R-2, and R-3 zoning designations as identified by Chapter 21 
of the Stanislaus County Code or Tile 17 of the Hughson Municipal Code, as applicable. 

Section 3404.2.9.5.1 All R-I, R-2, and R-3 zoning designations as identified by the 
Chapter 21 of the Stanislaus County Code or Title 17 of the Hughson Municipal Code, as 
applicable. 

Section 3406.2.4.4 All R-1 , R-2, and R-3 zoning designations as identified by Chapter 21 
of the Stanislaus County Code or Title 17 of the Hughson Municipal Code, as applicable. 

Section 3804.2 The incorporated boundary within the Hughson Fire Protection District. 

Sedion 5. That Ordinance No. 2 of the Hughson Fire Protection District entitled AN ORDINANCE 
ADOPTING THE 1998 CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, TITLE 24, PART 9, 
CALIFORNIA FlRE CODE (WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS) AND BY REFERENCE, THE 
UNIFORM FlRE CODE, 1997 EDITION, AND THE UNIFORM FlRE CODE STANDARDS, 1997 
EDITION PRESCRIBING REGULATIONS GOVERNiNG CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE 
AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE, HAZARDOUS MATERIALS OR EXPLOSION AND PROVIDING 
FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS FOR HAZARDOUS USES OR OPERATION and all other 
District ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed. 

Section 6. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, for any 
reason, held to be invalid or unenforceable, such decision shall not affect the validity of the 
remaining portions of this ordinance. The Board of Directors hereby declares that it would have 
passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the 
fact that any one or more section, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared 
invalid or unenforceable. 

Section 7. That nothing in this ordinance or in the Fire Code hereby adopted shall be construed to 
affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liabilrty incurred, or 
any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as 
cited in Section 5 of this ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be 
lost, impaired or affected by this ordinance. 

Section 8. That the Hughson Fire Protection District is hereby ordered and directed to cause this 
ordinance to be published. 

Section 9. That this ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and 
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect after its 
ratification by the Stanislaus County Board of Supervisors and the City Council of the City of 
Hughson as required by California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7(c). 

APPROVED by the Board of Directors of the Hughson Fire Protection District at a special meeting 
thereof duly held on February 1,2008, by the following vote: 

AYES: Directors VILLARREAL, CAMAGNA and VOSS 

NOES: None 

ABSENT: Director HUMPHREYS 

/ s /  Kevin Voss 
President of the 8oard 



ATTEST: 

/ s /  Jon G a l t  
Secr-ry 



Findings and Adoption of the 2007 California Fire Code 

The Board of Supervisors hereby finds and determines: That the International Code Council is a 
private organization, which has been in existence for at least three (3) years. That the California 
Fire Code, 2007 Edition, and 2007 California Fire Code Standards, published by said organization, 
are nationally recognized compilation of proposed rules, regulations, and standards of said 
organization. That said 2007 California Fire Code and Fire Code Standards have been printed and 
published as a code in book form within the meaning of Section 50022.2 et seq., of the 
Government Code. That one (1) copy of the 2007 California Fire Code and one (1) copy of the 
lnternational Fire Code Standards, certified by the Clerk to be true copies, have been filed for use 
and examination by the public in the office of the Clerk. That the sections of said 2007 California 
Fire Code and California Fire Code Standards may be referred to by the number used in said 
published compilation, preceded by the words "California Fire Code Section," "Fire Code Section," 
or "California Fire Code Section" and may also be referred to by additional reference to Municipal 
Code and sections therein pertaining to said 2007 California Fire Code and Fire Code Standards. 
That the additional requirements and standards established herein are needed to properly protect 
the health, safety, and welfare of the existing and future residents and workers of the Hughson Fire 
Protection District. Said requirements and standards are reasonably necessary because of local 
climatic, geological, and topographical conditions, and comply with existing state laws and 
regulations. 
Amendment of the 2007 California Fire Code is necessary so as to provide more stringent 
standards for fire extinguishing systems, fire hazard and hazardous materials controls is necessary 
to serve the public interest by reducing the risk to life and property of the citizens of Hughson Fire 
Protection District because of the following local conditions: 
(a) Summer weather conditions are very dry, hot and windy causing ordinary combustibles to be 
easily ignited and fires to be fast spreading; 
(b) Very dense fog conditions occur in winter. Reduced visibility causes delays in fire response; 
(c) Fire response is delayed by railroad tracks THEREFORE, for the above reasons taken 
individually and cumulatively and in accordance with the authority granted in Sections 17958.5 and 
17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code, the Council of the Hughson Fire Protection 
District expressly finds there are local climatic and topographical conditions that make the 
increased fire protection requirements set forth in this article reasonably necessary. 

Appeals 

Section 108.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code, Appendix Chapter 1 - Administration is hereby 
amended to read as follows: 
Applicant may appeal the decision of the Chief to the Hughson Fire Protection District within thirty 
(30) days from the date of the decision being appealed whenever the Chief: 
1. Disapproves an application for use of alternate materials, methods and/or types of construction, 
2. Disapproves an application for permit or refuses to grant a permit applied for, 
3. When it is claimed that the provisions of the code do not apply, or 
4. That the true intent and meaning of the code have been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted. 



Compliance with Orders, Notices and Tags 

Section 109.22 of the 2007 California Fire Code Appendix Chapter 1 - Administration is 
hereby amended to read as follows: 

Criminal Violations. It shall be unlawful for any person to violate any provision or to fail to 
comply with any of the requirements of this chapter. A violation of any of the provisions or 
failing to comply with any of the mandatory requirements of this chapter shall constitute a 
misdemeanor; except that notwithstanding any other provkion of this code, any such 
violation constituting a misdemeanor under this code may, in the discretion of the Hughson 
Fire Protection District Attorney, be charged and prosecuted as an infraction. Any person 
convicted of a misdemeanor under the provisions of this chapter, unless provision is 
otherwise herein made, shall be punishable by a fine of not more than one thousand 
dollars ($1,000.00) or by imprisonment in the county jail for a period of not more than six 
(6) months or by both fine and imprisonment. Any person convicted of an infraction under 
the provisions of this code, unless provision is o t h e k e  herein made, shall be punishable 
by a fine only as follows: Upon a first conviction, by a fine of not exceeding two hundred 
Mty dollars ($250.00) and for a second conviction or any subsequent conviction within a 
period of one year, by a fine of not exceeding five hundred dollars ($500.00). 
Each wch person shall be charged with a separate offense for each and every day during 
any portion of which any violation of any provision of this code is committed, continued or 
permitted by such person and shall, upon conviction, be punished accordingly. 

Administrative Penalties 

In addition to any other remedies set forth in this chapter, administrative penalties may be 
imposed against any person, as defined in Section 109.3 of this Code, for violating any of 
the requirements set forth in this chapter. Any administrative penatties assessed shall be 
as follows: 
(a) For violations of this Code, Possession, Sale, Use or Discharge of Dangerous 
Fireworks, the administrative penalty shall be five hundred dollars ($500.00) for each 
specific act found to be in violation of that section. 
(b) For all violations of this chapter, Possession, Sale, Use or Discharge of Dangerous 
Fireworks, the amount of the administrative penalty shall be one hundred dollars ($1 00.00) 
for the first violation, two hundred dollars ($200.00) for a second violation within any twelve 
(1 2) month period and five hundred dollars ($500.00) for any subsequent violations within 
any twelve (1 2) month period. 

Permit Required for Certain Operations 

2007 California Fire Code Appendix Chapter 1- Administration is hereby amended to read 
as follows: 
Sections 105.6.1 5, 105.6.1 9, and 105.6.30 are hereby deleted. 

Fees 
(a)Permit Fee. The Board of the Hughson Fire Protection District may, by resolution 
adopted from time to time, establish a fee for any permit issued pursuant to the Fire Code. 
(b) Plan Check Fee. When a plan is required to be submitted the plan-checking fee shall be 
paid at the time of submitting plans and specifications for checking. 
Where plans are incomplete, or changed so as to require an additional plan check, an 
additional plan-check fee shall be charged at a rate shown in a schedule setting forth fees 
as adopted from time to time by resolution of the Hughson Fire Protection Diitrict. 



Water Supplies and Fire Hydrants 

Section 508.5.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
Required Water Supply for fire protection. An approved water supply capable of 
supplying the required fire flow for fire protection shall be provided to premises upon which 
facilities, buildings or portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or moved into or within 
the jurisdiction. When any portion of the facility or building protected is in excess of 1 SO 
feet (45 720 mm) from a water supply on a public street, as measured by an approved 
route around the exterior of the faculty or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable 
of supplying the required fire flow shall be provided when required by the chief. 
Fire hydrants shall be located on the supply side of the fire suppression system check 
valve. 
Fire hydrants shall be accessible to the Fire Department apparatus by roads meeting the 
requirements of Section 503.1. 

Fire Extinguishing Systems Chapter 9 is amended as follows 

903.2.1 .I (A-1 Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2). 

903.2.1.2 (A-2 Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

'l. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 mZ). 

903.2.1 -3 (A-3 Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2). 
903.2.1.4 (A-4 Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2). 

903.2.2 (E Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2). 

903.2.3 (F-I Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2). 

903.2.6 (Rn Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

i . The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m3. 
903.2.7 (R Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

1 . The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2). 
2. All residential structures containing 5 or more dwelling units under a single roof. 

3. For buildings and structures classified as R-3 occupancies, the square footage 
of the structures shall include garages and all other enclosed spaces under 

one roof. Garages that share at least one common wall, roof or attic with the 
dwelling shall be considered under the same roof as the dwelling and shall be 
provided with automatic fire sprinklers when required by this chapter. 

903.2.7.1 (R Occupancy) Amend to read as follows: 

Buildings 30 feet or 3 stories in height. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall 
be installed throughout buildings with a floor level that is located 30 feet (9.144 m) 
or more above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access or 3 or more 
stories in height. 

903.2.7.2 (R Occupancy) Add to read; 

Cluster homes will be defined as a community of three or more buildings or structures over 
120 square feet (1 1 m3 in area, with a single point of fire truck access, when the access is 



less than 30 feet ( 9 m) in width. Constructed of rightweight building materials spaced ten 
feet or less apart. The construction is Type 5, in which walls, beams, girders, trusses and 
roofs are made of dimensional lumber. They have narrow travel lanes separating each 
occupancy. 

903.2.7.3. (R Occupancy) Add to read: 

Any building on plot sizes less than 5000 square feet. 

903.2.8 (S-1 Occupancy) Amend as follows: 

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2). 

903.2.8.1 (Repair Garages) Amend as foltows: 

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2). 

903.2.1 0.4 (6 Occupancy). Add to read: 
An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all buildings: 

I. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 mZ). 

903.2.1 9 (U Occupancy). Amend as follows: 

I. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m2). 

EXCEPTION: 
1. Non-residential buildings and unoccupied structures that are located in 
Agricultural zones and permitted by the planning Department under Code Section 
21 .ZO.OZO(A) 

903.2.1 8 Existing Buildings and Structures. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system 
shalt be installed in all existing buildings and structures when additions, alterations, or 
repairs are made within any twelve-month period that exceed fitty (50) percent of the total 
value (current county assessed valuation or valuation determined by a certified real estate 
appraiser) of an existing building or structure that exceeds five thousand (5,000) square 
feet (total floor area under roof) or which result in said building or structure exceeding five 
thousand (5,000) square feet (total floor area under roof). 

EXCEPTION: 
1 Non-residential buildings and structures that are located in Agricultural zones 

and permitted by the planning Department under Code Section 21.20.020(A) 

All buildings and structures classifies as R-3 or U occupancies. 

Each portion of an existing building or structure separated by one or more area 
separation walls, constructed in accordance with the current adopted edition of 
the Building Code, when each portion does not exceed five thousand (5,000) 
square feet. 

Existing buildings or 
sprinklers when the 
structures(s) is less 

struclres and their addition(s) are exempt from automatic 
cost of the remodel of the existing building(s) or 
than fifty (50) percent of the value (current county 

assessed valuation for improvements) of the buildings or structures, and 
sprinklers are permitted to be o m W  from the addiion(s), due to type of 
construction, use, or other special situations, by the California Fire Code or 
National Fire Protection Association Standard 13. 

903.2.1 8.1 For isolated buildings or groups of buildings (meeting the requirements of 
subsection 6 or 7 in rural area where no water is available from a municipal water system, 



a fire sprinkler system meeting all of the following criteria shall be considered as an 
alternative to systems that are in full compliance with the applicable NFPA Standard. 

I. Sprinklers will be designed and installed per the applicable NFPA Standards 

2. The required sprinkler demand (not including hose stream allowance) shall be 
provided by a hydro pneumatic tank for a minimum duration of 15 minutes. The 
Tank may be pressurized by the domestic well pump and may serve both the fire 
supply and domestic supply for the building. The tank must have a capacity equal 
to or greater than the calculated sprinkler demand. Calculations shall be provided 
to determine the actual size of tank required for each project. 

3. A separate storage tank or other water source acceptable to the chief shall be 
provided to accommodate sprinkler and hose demand for an additional 30 minutes 
beyond the storage required in 8(b). 

4. An Approved sprinkler system monitoring alarm as defined in section 1003.3.1 
of the Stanislaus County Fire Code shall be provided. 

EXCEPTION: Buildings and structures classified as R-3 are exempt from the 
storage tank requirements of 8(c). 

Fire Alarm Systems 
Section 907.1 -5 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended by adding the 
following: 
A certificate from Underwriterr Laboratories (UL) shall be required on all commercial fire 
alarm systems installed after the effective date of this ordinance. UL certification is required 
to be maintained for commercial fire alarm systems throughout the life of the alarmed building. 

Open Burning 

Section 307.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended by adding the following: 

Open burning. No person shall kindle, conduct, or maintain any burning of grass, weeds, 
agricultural trimmings, or other combustibles or authorize any such fire to be kindled, 
conducted, or maintained without a permit as required by the San Joaquin Valley Unified 
Air Pollution Control District and compliance with all safeguards pursuant thereto. Any such 
permitted burning shall be restricted to agricultural purposes and confined to areas of the 
Keyes Fire Protection D i c t  in which agricuttural uses are lawful. 

Type of Lock or Latch for Premises Where Gold or Bullion is Traded (NO=: 
Building Codel 

Section 1008.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is amended to add subsection 10 as 
follows: 
Special Latching Devices An exit door from a business which has as its primary 
commercial activity the sale, resale, exchange, or trade of gold or silver coin, bullion, or 
metal ore may be equipped with a locking mechanism which is not able open from inside 
without the use of a key or which requires special knowledge or effort so long as all of the 
following conditions are met during all times that the business is open to the public: 
1. The locking mechanism is connected to a smoke detector system in such a manner that 
activation or malfunction of the smoke detector system results in automsti.calty unlocking 
the exit door; 
2. The locking mechanism is connected to the electrical power supply for the building in 
such a manner that any loss of electrical power to the building results in automatically 



unlocking the exit door; 
3. Two (2) employees must be within Me area of the premises used for retail purposes, 
including adjacent service and utillty rooms, at all times; and 
4. A sign is permanently posted upon the premises so as to be readily seen by any person 
or persons entering the business stating that the management electronically controls 
ingress and egress. 

False Alarms 

Section 405.10 of fhe 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
False alarms shall not be given, signaled or transmitted or caused or permitted to be given, 
signaled or transmitted. The Hughson Fire Protection D i c t  may adopt by resolution 
reasonable fees to recover the coats associated with responses to building or structures 
that have excessive false alarms. 

Hot Works 

Section 2604.2.6 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to add the following: 
When required by the Chief a minimum 2-A: 208: C-rated fire extinguisher shall be 
mounted to each portable welding cart. 

Fireworks 

See Stanislaus County Code Chapter 9.84 Fireworks 

Restricted Locations of Flammable and Combustible Liquids in Tanks 

Section 3404.2.9.5.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as 
follows: 

Storage of Class I and \I Liquids in aboveground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited, 
with the exception of protected tanks designed, installed and maintained in accordance 
with the 2007 California Fire Code. The provisions of this section shall not apply to faalities 
for the production, generation, or transmission of electric energy that provide power to 
entities furnishing retail electrical services to the general public within the Hughson Fire 
Protection District. 

Operating Heating, Lighting, and Cooking Appliances Prohibited 

Section 3405.3.3 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to include the 
following: 

Class II and Ill Liquids 

Location of Bulk Plants for Storage of Flammable and Combustible Liquids 

Section 3406.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
The construction of new bulk plants for storage of flammable or combustible liquids is 
restricted to areas of the Hughson Fire Protection District zoned Heavy Industrial Zones. All 
existing nonconforming bulk plants for storage of flammable or combustible liquids, which 
substantially comply with the requirements of this Code, may be continued in use if the 
Chief grants a permit. 



Transfer Operations 

Section 3406.5.1 .I of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended by adding to the 
following: 
Tank vehicles and tank cars shall be unloaded as soon as possible after arrival at point of 
delivery and shall not be used as storage tanks. Unless otherwise approved, a tank car 
shall not be allowed to remain on a siding at the point of delivery for more than twenty-four 
(24) hours while connected for transfer operations. 

Hazardous Materials Permits 

Subsection 3 is added to Section 2701.5 of the 2007 California Fire Code: 
Key Box. When required by the Chief, an approved key box, shed to contain emergency 
information, shall be provided. 

Deposits of Hazardous Materials; Cleanup, Abatement, or Mitigation 
Required; Liibilii for Costs 

Section 2703.3.1.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Responsibility for cleanup The person, firm or corporation responsible for an 
unauthorized discharge shall institute and complete all actions necessary to remedy the 
effects of such unauthorized discharge, whether sudden or gradual, at no cost to the 
jurisdiction. When deemed necessary by the Chief, cleanup may be initiated by the Fire 
Department or by an authorized individual or firm. Costs associated with such cleanup shall 
be born by the owner, operator or other person responsible for the unauthorized discharge. 
The remedy provided by this section shall be in addition to any other remedies provided by 
law. 
For purposes of this section, costs incurred by the Hughson Fire Protection Dict shall 
include, but shall not necessarily be limited to, the following: actual labor costs of Hughson 
Fire Protection D i i c t  personnel, including worker's compensation benefits, fringe benefits, 
administrative overhead; cost of equipment operation; cost of materials obtained directly by 
the Hughson Fire Protection District; and cost of any contract labor and materials. The 
authority to recover costs under this section shall not include actual fire suppression s e ~ c e s  
that are normally or usually provided by the Fire Department. 

General Safety Precautions 
Section 312.2 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Protection from vehicles: Guard posts or other approved means shall be provided to 
protect storage tanks and connected piping, valves and fittings; dispensing areas; and use 
areas subject to vehicular damage. When guard posts are installed, the posts shall be: 
1. Constructed of steel not less than six (6) inches in diameter and concrete filled, 
2. Spaced not more than four (4) feet between posts on center, 
3. Set not less than three (3) feet deep in a concrete footing of not less than a fifteen (15) 
inch diameter, 
4. Set with the top of the posts not less than three (3) feet above ground, and 
5. Located not less than fwe (5) feet from the tank. 

Outside Storage and Use of Liquefied Petroleum Gases 

Section 3804.2 of the 2007 California Fire Code is amended as follows: 
The outside storage of liquefied petroleum gas (LPgas) shall conform to the provisions of 
Stanislaus County zoning ordinances. The outside storage and use of liquefied petroleum 
gases is restricted as specified in this section. 



1. Storage and dispensing of LP-gas for resale purposes, into approved containers and 
vehicles, is restricted to those areas of the Stanislaus County zoned as Commercial-Lig ht 
Industrial, Heavy Industrial, and, in addition thereto, to other comrnercialty zoned properties 
used as automotive service stations. Only qualified persons shaH perform dispensing. 
2. Dispensing of LP-gas for private use is restricted to those zones identified in subsection 
1, and when approved by the Chief, may be permitted in those areas of the Stanislaus 
County zoned General Commercial. Only qualified persons shall perform dispensing. 
3. For cooking, lighting, or heating in a building, only on a property that does not have 
natural gas s e ~ c e  edsting on a boundary line of said property or when prohibition of such 
storage would cause undue hardship. 
4. For temporary use on construction sites, when authorized by the Chief. 
5. For use as an alternative fuel supply for an emergency standby generator, when 
authorized by the Chief. 
6. For use with certain mobile vending and certain commercial barbecue equipment and 
other specific uses when authorized by the Chief. 
7. For use by Artisans in pursuit of their trade, when authorized by the Chief. 
8. Storage of portable containers awaiting exchange may be permitted in commercially 
zoned areas of the Stanislaus County, including those zoned Neighborhood Commercial, 
when approved by the Chief and stored in accordance with Section 3809. Such storage 
shall be located a minimum of twenty (20) feet from any fuel dispenser. 
9. Containers that exceed 2,000 gallons shall comply with procedure FPB 82-01 

Permits and Plans for Liquefied Petroleum Gases 

Section 3801 -2 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Permits. Permits shall be required as set forth in Appendix Chapter1 , Sections 105.6 and 
105.7 
EXCEPTION: 

1. Containers not exceeding five (5) gallon water capacity, used for "barbecuen 
cooking, when used and stored outside of buildings. 
2. Approved containers not exceeding sixteen and four-tenths (1 6.4) ounces when 
displayed for sale in mercantile occupancies. 
3. Factory installed containers for recreational vehicles not exceeding ten (1 0) 
gallon water capacity. 
4. Factory installed tanks that are permanently attached to recreational vehicles. 

Di ibuton  shall not fill an LPgas container for which a permit is required unless the fire 
code official has issued a permit for installation for that location. 

Supervision and Communication System 
Section 907.2.1.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows: 
Supervision. Places of assembly shall be under the constant supervision of a competent 
adult on the premises during the time that the premises are open to the public. 
Communications. When required by the chief, places of assembly shall be provided with 
a method for notifying the fire department in the event of an emergency. Such method can 
consist of a telephone, an alarm system connected to the fire department or other 
approved agency, or other apprwed means. Methods of notifying the fire department shall 
department shall be readily available to the public. 

Powered Industrial Truck Operation 
Section 309.7 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows: 
Powered Industrial trucks shall be listed and labeled for use in the environment intended 
and shall be in accordance with nationally recognized standards. 



Maintenance of Protected Aboveground Tanks 
Section 3404.2.7.3.5.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby added to read as 

follows: Protected aboveground tanks and connected piping shall be maintained in a safe 
operating condirtion. Protected aboveground tanks shall be maintained in accordance with 
their listings. Damage to protected aboveground tanks shall be repaired using material 
having equal or greater strength and fire resistance or the protected aboveground tank 
shall be replaced or taken out of service. 



Fire Apparatus Access Roads (Appendix D) 
Appendix D Table 0103.4 is amended as follows: 

or 100 foot cul-de-sac 

Special Approval Required 

Appendix D Figure D103.1 is amended as follows: 
Dead-End Fire Apparatus Access Road Turnaround 



MlNlMUM CLEARANCE 
:. AROUNDA EIRE 

- ' .  " HYDRANT 

'00 '  HAMMERHEAD 

N o t e :  Drawing not to sca le .  

1 0 oe DIAMETER 
C UL-DE-SAC 

ACCEPTABLE ALTERNATIVE 
TO 1 0 0 ~  HAMMERHEAD . - 


