THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF STANISLAUS

ACTION AGENDA SUMMARY
DEPT: CEO / OES - Fire Warden G Brssney BOARD AGENDA #__*B-9
Urgent D Routine [i_‘] AGENDA DATE _June 3. 2008
CEO Concurs with Recommendation YES NO [T] 4/5 Vote Required YES [_| NO (H]

(Informtation Attached)

SUBJECT:

Approval to Ratify Turlock Rural Fire District and Hughson Fire District Ordinances Adopting and Amending the
2007 California Fire Code

STAFF RECOMMENDATIONS:

1. Ratify ordinances passed by Turlock Rural Fire District and Hughson Fire District adopting and amending the
2007 California Fire Code.

2. Authorize the Stanislaus County Fire Warden or his designee to file a copy of the findings, with the Building
Standards Commission as prescribed by Government Code (§17958.7; §13869.7).

FISCAL IMPACT:

The proposed ordinances will update the Turlock Rural Fire District and the Hughson Fire District's regulations for
the enforcement of the State Fire Code and amendments within their jurisdictions of the County. There is no fiscal
impact associated with this item.

Noes: Supervisors:______________| NN
Excused or Absent: Supervisors:_ _Grover ____
Abstaining: Supervisor:_________ _NONe _

1) X Approved as recommended

2) Denied

3)  Approved as amended

4) Other:

MOTION:

_Wg‘m DF-04-33

ATTEST: CHRISTINE FERRARO TALLMAN, Clerk File No. DF-12-B-24




Approval to Ratify Turlock Rural Fire District and Hughson Fire District Ordinances
Adopting and Amending the 2007 California Fire Code

Page 2
DISCUSSION:

The ordinances, when ratified by the Board of Supervisors, will update the Turlock Rural
Fire District and Hughson Fire District’s regulations for the enforcement of the State Fire
Code and amendments within their jurisdictions of the County.

The California Fire Code is the primary code used to regulate and enforce fire safety
standards in California. Every three years, as part of the California Building Standards
Code, the State of California amends the International Fire Code and adopts it as the
California Fire Code. The California Fire Code applies throughout the State 180 days
after its adoption by the State. (Health and Safety Code §17958.) The state most recently
adopted revisions to the California Fire Code on July 1, 2007. The attached ordinances
update and amend the local fire code in the Turlock Rural Fire District and Hughson Fire
District to be consistent with the current State Fire Code and amendments for local
conditions.

A local jurisdiction, such as a fire protection district, may establish more restrictive
building standards in their Fire Code than those contained in the State or County Fire
Code that are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological, to topographical
conditions. (Health and Safety Code §§13143.5, 17958, 8941.5 (b).) Before making
changes or modifications to the State Fire Code, the Districts must make findings that the
changes are necessary due to local climatic, geological or topographical conditions in
their districts. (§17958.7.) Once adopted, the ordinance must be transmitted to the
County where the ordinance will apply. The Board of Supervisors may ratify, modify, or
deny an adopted ordinance and transmit its determination to the district within 15 days of
the determination. After ratification, the county is required to file a copy of the finding
related to local conditions, together with the modification or change with the California
Building Standards Commission.

The ordinances adopted by the Turlock Rural Fire District and Hughson Fire District are
attached. It is expected that as other districts pass their ordinances they will be brought to
the Board in a similar fashion.

POLICY ISSUES:
The Board should determine if approval of this ordinance supports the Board’s priorities
of a safe community and a healthy community.

STAFFING:
There is no staffing impact associated with this request.




e

TURLOCK RURAL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
RESOLUTION NO. 2007-3"

An ordinance of the Turtock Rural Fire Protection District adopting the 2007 edition of the Califomnia
Fire Code, regulating and goveming the safeguarding of life and.property fiom fire and explosion *
hazards arising from the storage, handiing and use of hazardous substances, materiais and devices,
ang from conditions-hazardous to-life-or-property-in-the-occupancy of buildings and premises in the
Turdock Rural Fire Protection District, providing for the issuance of permits and coliection of fees
therefore; repeating all other crdinances and pads of such ordinances in conflict therewith.

The Board of Directors of the Turtock Rural Fire Protection District does ordain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, ons (1) copy of which is on file in the office of the Slanislaus
County Fire Prevention Bureau, being marked and designated as the California Fire Code, 207
edition, including Appendix Chapters 1and 4, Appendices A, B, C, D, E, F, and G as published by the
international Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the Turlock Rural Fire
Department, in the State of California regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property
from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances,
materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property-in the occupancy of buildings
and premises as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permit and collections of fees
therefore; and eaeh-and-all-of the regulations; provisions, penaities,-conrditions an terms of said Fire
Code on file in the office of the Turlock Rural Fire Depariment are hereby-referred to, adopted, and
made part hereof, as if fully set.out-in-this-ordinance; with the addibons; insertions, deletions and
changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance. -

Section 2. That the following-sections of Appendix.Cliapter-1 are hereby revised:

Section 101.1. Title These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the Turlock Rural
Fire Protection Distrret; hereirr referred to as “this code.”

Section 109.3. Violation Penalties. Persons who shall Violate a provision of this code shall
fail to comply withrany of the requirements. thiereaf or who.shall.erect, install, after, repair or
do any work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code
official, or af-a peamitof certificate used under. provisians of this coda, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable by a fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues

after due notfice-has been served shalt bs desmed a separata offense.

Section 114.4. Failure to Comply. Any person who shall continue to work after having .
been served withrastopwork arder, except such work as that person is directed to pedorm io
remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine not less than $500 doflars or
more than 1,000 doHers.,

Section 3. That the geographic limits rafsired to in certain sections of the 2007 California Fire Code
are hereby established as follows:

Section 3204 .3 11 AltR-1, R-2, and!t&zomngdaﬂgnabonsassdanhﬁed by Title 10 of the
Turiock Rural Fire Protection District.

Section 3404 2.9 5 1 TALRA, @,msr-azonmgdeagmonsastdentzﬁeo‘by Fitle 10 of
the Turlock Rural Fire Protection District.

Section 3406.2.4:4 Al R-T, R-2, and R-3zoning designations as identified by Title 10 of the
Turlock Rural Fire Protection District.

Section 3804 2 The boundaries within-the Turlock Rural Fire Protection District.




TURLOCK RURAL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Section 4. That all other ordinances-and reseiutions or parts of oréxmnceand resolutions in conflict
herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 5. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, for any
reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions
of this ordinance - The Board of Directors hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance,
and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, imespective of the fact that any one or more
section, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 6. That nothing in this ordinance or in the Fire Code hereby adopted shall be construed to
affect any suit-or proceeding imperding in any court, or any rights acquired, or Eability incurred, or

any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as’
cited-in Section-4-of this erdinance;: norshall any just or legal right orremedy of any character-belost,
impaired or affected by this ordinance.

Section 7. That the Turiock Rural Fire Deparlmen{ is hereby ordered and directed to.cause this
ordinance to be published. .

Section 8. That this ordinance and the nules, regulation, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters estsblished and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect ON JANUARY
1, 2008, fram and afier the date of its final passage-and adoption.

.

The foregoing resolution was introduced as a regular meeting of the Turlock Rural Fire Protection
District Board of Directnrs Meeting held.on Dacember-11, 2007 ‘Boeard-Member .1. Wilkey moved that
the resolution be adopted and was duly seconded by Board Member B. Rice. The vote was called for

and the resolutimrwasactmtedhytb&foﬁmdngv&esg
AYES: Board Members; Chairman B. Genzoli
- Witkey
R. Macedo
JHughes
B: Rice
NOES: None

ABSENT: None

ATTEST: Steven Williams, Sec/Tr




61/31/2008 THU 15:04 FAX WjBu3/01Z

Findings and Adoption of the 2007 Californla Fire Code

The Board of Supervisors hereby finds and determines: That the international Code Council is a
private organization; which has-been in existence for-at least three (3) years. That the California
Fire Code, 2007 Edition, and 2007 California Fire Code Standards, published by said arganization,
are nationally recogmized camnpilation of proposcd rules, regulations, and standards of said
organlzation. That said 2007 California Fire Code and Fire Code Standards have been printed and
published as a code inbook form within the meaning of Seclion 50022.2 et seq,, of the
Government Code. That one (1) copy of the 2007 California Fire Code and one (1) copy of the
International Fire-Code-Standards; certified by-the-Clerk 1o be true copies. have been filed for use
and exarminalion by the public in the office of the Clerk. That the sections of said 2007 California -
Fire Code and Californla Fire Code Standards may be referred to by the numbes used in said
published compilation, preceded by the words *Caifornia Fire Code Section,” “Fire Code Section.”-
or "Californla Fire Code Section” and may also be referred to by additional reference to Municipal
Code and sections therein pertaining ta saig 2007 California Fire Code and Fire Code Standards.
That the additional requirements and standards established herein are needed to properly proteet
the health, safety, and welfare-of the-existing and future residents and workers of the Turlock Rural
Fire Proteclion District. Said requirements and standacds are reasonably necessary because of
local climatic, geological,. and topagraphical conditions, and complythhexuskngsxake laws and
regulations.

Amendment of the 2007 Califarnia Fira Codea is necessary so as {o provide more stringent
standards for fire extinguishing systems, fire hazard and hazardous materials controls is necessary
to serve the public interest-by reducing the risk tolifs:and:praperty. of the cmzens of Turdeck Rura)
Fire Protection District because of the following local conditions:

() Summer weather conditians are very.dey, hol and-windy- causmg ordmary combusnb!es to be
casily ignited and fires to be fast spreading;

(b) Very dense fog conditions occurin winter.. Reduced visibility causes delays in fire response;

(c) Fire response is delayed by railroad lracks THEREFQRE, for the-above reasons taken
individually and cumulatively.aid.in.accordance with the authority-granted in Sections 17958.5 and
17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code, the Council of the Turlock Rural Fire Protection
District expressly finds there-are-oest climatic -and-topographical conditions that makse the
increased fire protection requirements set forth in this article reasonably necessary.

Appeals

Section 108.1 of the 2007 Califarnia Fira Cada, Appendlx Chapter-1- Adminisiration is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Applicant may appeal the.decision of-the .Chief. to&he Turlock Rural Fire Protection District within
thirty (30} days from the date of the decision being-sppealed whenever.the Chief:

1. Disapproves an application for use of altaenate .materials, methods and/or fypes of construction,
2. Disapproves an application for permit or refuses to grant a permit applied for,

3. When it is claimed that.the.provisions of tha code-da-not apply, or

4. That the true intent and meaning of the code have besn mssconstrued or wrongly mterpreted



U1/317LUUG 1ML 10104 rAA

Wuuasu1z

Compliance with.Qrders, Notices and Tags

Seclion 108.2.2 of the 2067 California Fire Code Appendix Chapter 1 - Administration is hereby
amended to read as folows:.

Criminal Violations. it shall ba unlawful for any person to violate any provision or to fail to compiy
with any of the requirements of this chapter. A violation of any of the provisions or failing to comply
with-any-of the mandatery requirements of this chapter shall constitute a misdemeanor; except that
notwithstanding any other provision of this code, any such violation constituting 2 misdemeanor
under this code may, in the discretion of the Turlock Rural Fire Protection District Atlorney, be
charged and proseculed as an infraction. Any person canvicted of a misdemecanor under the
provisions of this chapler, unlass provision is otherwisc herein made, shall be punishable by a fine
of not more than one thoussnd dofars (31,000.00) or by imprisonment In the county jail for a
period of not more than six-(6} months-or by both fine and imprisonment: Any person convicted of
an infraction under the provisions of this code, unless provision is otherwise hereln made, shall be
punishable by afine.anly as follows: Upon.a first canviction, by.a fine of not exceeding two
hundred (ifly dollars (3250.00) and for a second conviction or any subsequent conviction within a
period of one year, by a flne of not exceeding five hundred dolars {$500.00).

Each such person shall be charged with a separate offense for each and every day during any
portion of which-any violation of any provision-of this-code is committed; commued or permitted by
such person and shail, upon conviction, be punished accordingly.

Administrative Penallto&

In addition to any other remedies seLfodh in this chapter, administralive penalties may be imposed
against any person, as defined in Section 109.3 of this Code, for.violating any of the requirements
set forth in thig chaptar. Any, administrative peaalties assessed.shall be as follows:

(a) For violations of this Code, Possassion, Sale, Use or Discharge of Dangerous Fireworks, the
administrative penalty shalt be five hundred dollars (8500.00} fée-each. specaﬂcactfomd to be'in
violation of that section.

(b) For all violations of this chapler, Possession, Sale, Usa or.Discharge of Dangesous Fireworks,
the amount of the administrative penalty shall be one hundred dollars ($100.00) for the first
violation, two-hundred doHars ($206.00} for a- secanct viatation within any.twelve (12) month period
and five hundred dollars ($500.00) for any subsequent violations within any twelve (12) month -
period.

Permit Required for-Certain-Operations

2007 €atifornia Firo Code Appendix Chapter 1- Adrhinistration is hereby amended to read as

follows:
Sactions 105.6.15, 105.6.19, and 105.6.30 are hereby deleted.

Fees

(a)Permit Fee. The Board-of-the-Tuslock -Rural Flre-Proteetion District-may. by resolution adopted
from time to time, 3 fee for any permit issued pursuant lo the Fire Code.

(b) Plan Check Fee. When a plan is raquired.to be submitted the plan-checking fee shall be paid-at
the lime of submitting plans and specifications for checking.

Where plans are incomplete, or.changed. so.as o require an additional plan cheek; an additional

4 —

I



0173172008 THY 15:05 FAX 1005/012

plan-check fae shall be charged.al a rate shown in a schedule sstting forth fees as adonted from
time to time by resolution of the Turlock Rurai Fire Protection District.

Water Supplies and Fire Hydrants

Section 508.5.1 of the 2007 Califarnia Fire Cods is hereby amended to read as foliows:

Required Water Supply for fire protection. An approved water supply capabie of supplying the
required fire flow for fire protection shatt be-provided to premises upon which facilities, buildings or
portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction. When any
portion of the facilify or-building protected-is-in excess-of 150 feet (45 720 mm) from a water supply
on 3 public street, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the faculty or building,
on-site fire hydrants and maios capable of supplying the required fire flow shail be provided when
required by the chief.

Fire hydrants shall be located on the supply side of the fire suppression system check valve.

Fire hydrants shall be accessibte tothe Fire: Department. apparatus by roads meeting the
requirements of Section 503.1.

Fire Extinguishing Systems Chapter 9 is amended as follows
903.2.1.1 (A-1 Occupancy) Amend. as follows:

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m’).
903.2.1.2 (A-2 Occupancy) Amend as follows: |

1. The building exceads.5,000-square feet (465 m’).
003.2.1.3 {A-3 Occupancy) Amend as follows: :

1. The building exceeds 5,008 square feet (465 m?),
903.2.1.4 (A-4 Occupancy) Amend as follows: :

1. The building cxcoeds 5;000-squere feet (465 m?).
903.2.2 (E Occupancy) Amend as follows: -

1. The building exceeds 5,000 squaro feet (465 m?).
903.2.3 (F-1 Occupancy) Amend as follows:

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).
903 2.6 (M Occupancy) Amend as followss

1. The building exceeds 5,000 Squr;tre feet (465 m?).
903.2.7 (R Occupancy) Amend -asfollows:

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 mz),

2. All residential structures containing 5 or more dwelling units under a single roof.
5




‘NOILJ30X3

‘(001 Japun ease

i00y)) 1B101) 1994 2ienbs (000’S) PuESNOY) oAy Buipsadxe ainoans Jo BUIPING PIES Urlnsas Yojum
10 ({005 13pun Lwse JOUYS [107) 199} J1ENDS ((NO°C) PULSNOUI- Oy SPesdxXe Jeyy ainongs Jo buipiing
Buyisixa ue jo (1astesdde 91y (a1 paypao B AQ PIUIWIBISP UOHEN|EA JO UDAEN(EA PISSOssE
AunoD uano) anjea jejo} au) J0 Ju921ad {0S) AN PaISoxa ey PouSd Yiuow-aaioml Aue Uiyim
apeuw a1e syedsal J0 ‘suoelaye ‘suonippe uaym sainpniys pue sBuippng Buisixe jje ut pageisul aq
eus woasAs sapjuude iy-qewaine posoidde uy- :saimpaniis-puesbuipying Bugsig gL'Z2'c06

(v)020°02'12
U012ag 9poD AUNOY SNeSIue;S Japun Juswpeda( Butuueld au) AQ palliwiad pue seuoz

{eminouby Ut pajeoo]Bse jey) Seunionits paidnssoun puesEMPING TENUSNISSI-UON 'L
‘NOILd3OX3

’l';ﬂ%h}%a%&[‘?ﬂbs -000'G spavoxe Buipiing suL 'L
SMO||0) SE puewly (Aouednao0n) 6L°2°€06

“(,W G9p) 193) 2senbs QUG SPIRNE HummMo 8y |
:sBuipiing jie xnoqﬁnon.n PIlieIsul 9q jeys WLsAs Japjuiids 911 ajRwWOoINe uy

L:pss.01-ppy {Aouednoan 8)  ¥'0L'TE0R

(,w oY) 199j alenbs 000'G SPI3IXd Butping ayL °1
“smoto) se puewy (sebeieo seday) L'g'2'e06

(W §9) 190)-e4enbs 009 9paeaxa Bulpiing oy |
1SmO|j0} SE puawy (AouednaoQ 1-S) 82 €06

'}128) s1enbs QQOG-ueY) sS8|-$821s 10id uo Buip|ing Auy
‘peas 0} ppy (AouednaoQ H) '€ LTE06

~Aouednooo yses -Buyeredes-goue|{oril-moiseU oAy ASy ] JaquIn|

{EUOISUBWIP JO BPEL Q€ $J001 pue sassny) ‘s1opad ‘sweaq ‘s|em yoaygm ul ‘g adA] st UDIINISUD)
sy “wede s3] JO (@8] Us] paoeds sfeudiew Buiping jybemiyBl 4o PRIoNAsuo?) “yipm Ll (W ¢ ) 198}
OF Uey} $$3] St $$IOTE By} UDYM ‘SSIDIE HONni] 94y JO Wiod BUS B yum ‘BIJe Ui ( w | {) 199} asenbs
021 240 S2IMONS 30 SOUIPHNG SJ0W JO S81Y} JO AUNWIWOD B SE pauyap aq ||zm S8WOY 431SN1)

‘peas 0} ppy {AouednadQ M) 7'L7 €06

b1y U1 SS1I0JS SI0W JO § JO SS2IE 2IIUDAIURLIYEAID 3. JO.19AD] 1SOMO| BY) 8A0GE
a10W Jo (W ppy 6) 199} OF PIIED0] S1 1Y) 1348} Joojj e yiim sBuippng jnoyBnouy; pajejsul
8q jleys walsAs Japjuuds ady onewoine uy JyBioy ul sejtois ¢ 10 1993 o¢ sBuping

'SMOJ|0) SB Pedl 0} puawy (AouednaoQ M) 1°2°2°C06

‘saydeyd siyl Ag pasndal uUBYM SIspjunds

3Jl} JHRWOINE )M Papiacid 59 jjeys pue Guljiomp Y} SE 1004 2UWES SY] JOPUN PIBPISLOT
99 {{eys Buijomp ay) Yiim 1)) i JOOI ‘fiBM uGwiwod aua jseafie aeys Jey) ssbeseg

4001 8UQ J9pUN S0EdS PISODU3 19Y10 He pur sabeiel apniout jiBYS SAININS 34} 40
afiejooy asenbs ay) ‘'8a121URINII0 ¢-3 SE PAIFSTE SQINONUS pue sBuppng 104 ¢

210/8000 Xv4 €0:S7T aHL 800Z/12/10



L

:Bumo(ioy aul-Buippe-Ag-popueue-Agasot S opOTy 943 eIUIONeD /002 U] JO L L0E uoNols
Buiuung uadg

‘Buipiing pawiele ayl jo aj au} INoYBnouy; SwalsAs. wee @4y [B1346 W0 10§ pauleluiew

aq 01 painbes St UONEIILSI 1) "BIUBUIPIC S} JO BIBD BNIJRJJo DYl TOYE pajjejsul SWwa)sAs
WCIE 4y [EIDIDWWIOI JIE U0 palsinbe. eq (jleys () SsuieIogqe SIUMISPUI] WOl 9leayiiad v
© :Bumotio ety Guppe Aq papuewe AQasay SIBPOY S BRICIED Z00Z 24l 10 §'L 206 UONDaS

sAg wiejy ang

‘(2)g 30 sjuawannbas
suer 65910193‘41 U-'W} TdWwoXS 9L LY Se payisse sampPnispueshum)ing :NOILdIOXI

. ‘papiaoad aq fjeys apo a4 Ajunos) snejsiuels
TUT JO 1 £ 'CO0L UONIDS W PaUYSp SE -UHee: BuUiojIoUL UsSAS sapunds paaolddy Uy ¢

g utpaunbay abesols
ay} puokaq sajnuiu (g [eUOGIhppe ue 10§ pUBLUeD 2SOY PUe JIULIdS SJEPOWIWOIE 0)
paptaoid aq (feys-4suo syl 0} s[qejdesse goines satem 19y10-10 wej-ebelols ajeiedas v ¢

“y9ej01¢ ysee 104 pannbas yue)

JO 9ZIS {eMIC 3y} SuIwISIRP 0} papircid aq JiBeysS suoiendie) “puewap RULIdS peTemoEs
ay} veyy1eteest 100 renbs Aysedes e aney ysnw yuer syl Bupmmg e Joj Aiddns
Jsewop pue Aiddns aily alfi Yloq 2A13s Aew pue dwnd fjam JSIWOP dy) Aq pazunssaid
aq Aew yue | 9y | “SNUIW’ GO UOITEINP WNUAUTW 10} YUe) Jrewnseud oIpAy e Ag
PIPIACIU 34 (leyS-(eouemoye weals asoy Bulpnidur Jou) puewsp sepuds paanbas ayy 'z

SPIEPUBIS V4N diqedidde syi sad pafieisul pue-paubsep-aq fim siopunds ‘|

. ‘pJepuels vd4N alqestydde syj uim soueidwos

(Iny ur a1e Jey} SWasAS 0] BANBUIDYE UL SE PIJOpISUoY aq TeyS erojro Humojo} ayl 1o jje Bugasw
WSISAS JSpULI]S D1y € ‘WBISAS 1aJEeM feTidiuNW B WOl diqeiieae St JSlem OU 3J9Ym ea.e feins ul 7 30
g uoROesans jo suswalNnbas syl Bueau )} sbulping 40-6dnos6 4o-sBurpting peie(os] J0 |L'gL"2'C06

‘€L

pPIEPUE|S UOHBIVOSSY UONI3j01d aii4 [BUOIIEN 10 807 ali4 eulofije] ay AG ‘suonenys

[eads 410 J0 ‘98N ‘UONINNSUOI Jo 8dhj 0} anp (S)UCHIPPE JY) WOLS peyjiwio

64 0} paniwisad are sispjuids pue ‘saunonas 10 sBuppng ey Jo (Sjuswanoiduw

0 UolENlEA PBSSESSE AJUNOD JUBLIND) BnjeA ay) jo Juedted (0G) APy uey] $$9]

st {s)samponss o (s)Buping Gunsixe sy| Jo [@powel 8y JO 1500 3Y) Usym sI1apjuiids
onewone woy 1dwaxa ese (suonippe S1ay) pue saanonys 10 sbupung buisixg ¢

"1994 asenbs {QQQ'G) puesnay} aaly pa3IXS Jou saop uoipod yoee usym ‘apo)) Buippng
8y Jo uoHIEY PoJdopPE WUBLNT 8Y) YiIM 8IUBPICIIE Ui PIIIRNRSUOS ‘Sijlem uojesedas
eale 210w 10 ouo Aq pajesedas aunjoruls 10 Buiping Buysixs ue jo uoniod ysey ¢

"$310uEdN220 N 10 £-3 §€ SAISSe)D sempPnss pue SBUPINQ Iy ¢
(V)020'02 12

U01j29g 8P AJUNOY sNe|siuels 1Bpun Juatujiedad buliued sy} Aq pajiwiad
pue ssuoz einynaubly ur paIed0| Jue ey SIS pue SBUPINg [euapISal-uoN 'L

Yvd CN:ICT AHT RaNZ/1¢/Tn

210/L00@



61/31/2008 THU 15:06 FAX

hoos 012

Open burning. No person.-shali-kindle- conduct, or maintain any burning of grass, weeds,
agricultural trimmings, or other combustibles or authorize any such fire o be kindled, conducted, or
maintained without a permit as.reguired-by-the-San Joaguin Valley Unified Air Poliution Conirol
District and compliance with all safeguards pursuant thereto. Any such permitled burning shall be
restricted to agricultural purpases. and .confined to-assas of the Turlock Rural Fire Protection
District in which agricultural uses are lawful. -

Type of Lock or Latch for Premiscs Where Gold or Bullion is Traded (MoTE: Building Code)

Section 1008.1 of the 2007 Cadifornia-Fire Code is amended to add subsection 10 as follows:
Special Latching Devices An exit door from a business which has as its primary commercial
activity the sale, resale, exchange, ar trade of gold or silver coin, bullion, or melal.ore may be
equipped with a locking mechanism which is not able open from inside without the-use of a key or
whicty requires special knowledge or effar so long as all of the foliowing conditions are met during
all times that the business is open to the public:

1. The locking mechanism is-connected-to a smoke detector systern in sm:hemanner that
activation or malfunclion of the smoke datector system resuits in automatically unlocking the exit
door; .

2. The locking mechanism is-connected to the- eleotrical power supply-for the building in such a
manner that any loss of electrical power to the building resulls in automatically unlocking the exit
door;

3. Two (2) employees musl be within the atea of the premises used for. retad ‘purposes, including
ad;acunt service and utility rooms, at all times; and

4, A sign is permanently pasted upan.the premises.so.as-10 be.readily- seen by any-person or
persons entering the business stating that the management electronically controls-ngress and

egr?ss.

False Alarms

Section 405.10 of the 2007 Califarnia Fite Code-is hereby amended lo read as follows:

False alarms shall not be given, signaled or transmitted or caused or permitted to be given,
signaled or transmitted. The.Tutlock Rural.Fire.Protection District. may adopt. by resolution
reasonable fees terecover the costs associated with responses to building or structures that have
excessive false aianps.

!

Hot Works

Section 2604 .2.6 of the 2007 Califacnia Fice . Code is hereby amended.io.add the following:
When required by the Chief a minimum 2-A: 20B: C-rated fire exlinguisher shall be mounted to
each portable welding cart. .

Fireworks .

See Stanislaus County Code Chapter 9.84 Fireworks

Restrictod Locations-of-Flammabie and-Combustible-Ligquids in Tank&\

Section. 3404.2 9.5.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as foliows:
Storage of Class | and Il Liguids in aboveground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited, wilh the
exception of protected tanks designed, installed and mainlained in accordance with the 2007

8



01-31/72008 THU 15:08 FAX g]1008/012

California Fire Code. The. provisions-of this seciion shail not apply-to facilities for-the-production,
generation, of fransmission of eleclsic energy that provide power to entities furnishing retail
electrical services lo the genesab public within the Turlock Rural Fire Protection District.

Operating Heating, Lighting, and Coching Appliances Prohibited

Section 3405 3.3 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended o include the following:
Class Il and HI Liquids

Location of Buik Plants for.Storage of Flammable and-Ceombustibie Liquids

Section 3406.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended o read as follows:

The construction of new bulk plants far storage of flammable or combustible liquids is restricted to
areas of the Turiock Rural Fire Protection District zoned Heavy Industrial Zones. All existing
noncenforming butk ptants for storage: of flammatite arcambustible liquids, which substantiaify
comply with the requirements of this Code, may be continued in use if the Chief grants a permit.

Transfer Operations- -

Section 3406.5.1.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended by adding to the following:
Tank vehicles and tank cars shall be unloaded as soon.as possibie after. arrival at point of delivery
and shall not be used as storage tanks. Unless otherwise approved, a tank car shail not be
allowed {o remaln on a siding at the point.of dalivesy.for-more than &wenty—four (24)-hours while
connected for transfer operations.

Hazardous Materials Permits

Subsection 3 is addad to Section 2701.5 of the 2007 California Fire Code:
Key Box. When required by.tha Chief,’an approved-key box, sized to contain emergency
information, shall be provided.

Deposits of Hazardous Materials; Cléanup, Abatament, oLM;tigaucn Requed'
Liability for Costs

Section 2703.3:1.4 of the 2007 California Fire.Code is hereby amended.to read as follows:
Responsibility for cleanup The person, firm or corporation responsible for an pnauthorized
discharge shall institute and.complete.all.actions. neeessary to remedy the effects of such
unauthorized discharge, whether sudden or gradual, at no cost to the jurisdiction. When deemed
necessary by the Chief; cleanupmay be:initiated tiy the Fire' Department or by an authorized
individual or firm, Costs associated with such cleanup shall be born by the owner, operator or other
person responsible for the unautharized discharge. The remedy -provided by ths sec&von -shall b2 n

addition to any other remedies provided by law.
For purposes of this.section, costsincusred by the Trlock Rural-Fire Pretection District shall include,

but shall not necessarily be limited to, the following: actual labor.costs of Turlock Rural Fire
Protection District personnel,.including worker’s compensation-benefits,; fringe benefits, administrative
overhcad; cost of equipment operation; cost of materials obtained directly by the Turduck Rural Fire
Protection Dislrict; and-cost-of-any contract tatarand materiats. The autharity ta recover costs under
this section shall not include actual fire suppression services that are normally or usually provided by




01-31/2008 THU 15:06 FAX

the Fire Department,

General Safety Precautions
Section 312.2 of the 2007 California Fire Cade is hereby amended lo read as follows:;
Protection from vehicles: Guard posts or other approved means shall be provided tc protect
storage tanks and connected piping, vatves and fitlings; dispensing areas; and use areas subject
to vehicular damage. When.quard posis. are instalied, the-posis shall ba: :
1. Constructed of steel not less than six (6) inches in diameter and concrete filled,
2. Spaced nat mare.than four (4) feet hetween posts.on-center,
3. Set not less than three (3) feet deep in a concrete fooling of not less than a fifteen (15) inch
diameler,
4. Set with the top of the posis natlless.than three (3) feet above ground, and
5. Localed not less than five (5) feet from the lank.

Outslide Storage and Use of Liquefied Petroteurnt Gases

Section 3804 .2 of the 2007 California Fire Cods is amended as follows:
The outside storage of liguefied patroleum gas (LP-gas) shall conform to the pravisions of
Stanisiaus County zoning ordinances. The outside storage ang use of liquefied petroleum gases is

restricted as specifiedﬂlbi&%&cﬁ%n.

1. Storage and dispensing of LP-gas for resale purposes, into approved containers and vehicles, is
reslricted lo those areas of the Stanislaus County zoned.as Coémmercial-Light Industrial, Heavy
Industrial, and, in addition thereto, to other commercially zoned properlies used as-automotive
service stations. Only qualified persons shall perfarm. dispensing,

2. Dispensing of LP-gas for private use is restricted to those zones identified in subsection 1, and
when approved by the Chief, may be permitted in those-areas of the Stamslaus»COtm(y zoned
General Commercial. Only qualified persons shall perfarm dispensing.

3. For cooking, lighting,.or. heating in a building, -only-on a praperty that does not have natural gas
service existing on a boundary line of said property or when prohibition of such storage would
cause undue i

4. For temporary ust canslruction sites, when authorized by the Chiafy,

5. For use as an alternative fuel supply for an emergency standby generator, when authorized by
the Chief.

6. For use with certain mobile vending and certain commercial barbecue equipment and other
specific uses when authorized by the Chief.

7. For use by Artisans in pursuit of their trade, when authorized by the-Chief,

8. Storage of portable containers awaiting exchange may be permitted in commercially zoned
areas of the Stanislaus. Ceunty, including those 2orred Neighborhood Commercial, when approved
by the Chief and stored in accordance with Section 3809 Such slorage shall be located a.
minimum of twenty (20) feet-from-any {uet dispenser

9. Containers that exceed 2,000 gallons shall comply with procedure FPB 82-01

Permits and Plans for Eljuefiod PETtoiEsm Gases
Section 3801.2 of the 2007 Eakfernia-Fire-Code is hereby amendedto read-as follows:
Psrmits. Permits shali be required as sef forth in’ Appendix Chapten Sections 105.6 and 105.7-

EXCEPTION: -
1. Containers not exceeding five (5) galfon water capacity. used for “barbecue cooking,

when used and stored outside of buildings.
2. Approved contaimers notexceeding sixteen . and four-denths(16.4)-ounces when
displayed for.sale .in mercantile occupancies, -

10

#1010/012



Wwju11-su12

0173172008 THU 15:U7 FAX

3. Factory instalied containers-for recreationat vehicies not exceeding ten (10) galion water

capacity.

4. Factory installed tanks that are permanently attached to recreationai vehlcles.
Distributors shall not fill an LP-gas container for which a permil Is required unless the fire code
official has issued a permit for installation for that lecation.

Supervision and Communication System
Section 907.2.1.4 of the 2007. California Eire Code is hereby added to read as follows:
Supervision. Places of assembly shall be under the constant supervision of a competent adult on
the premises during the time that the premises ore oper to the public. Communications. When
required by the chief, places of assembly shall be provided with a method for notifying the fire ~
department in the event of an emergency. Such method can consist of a telephone, an alarm
system connected to the fire department or other approved agency, or other approved means.
Methods of notifying the fire department shall department shall be readily available to the public.

Powered Industrial Truck Operation
Section 309.7 of the 2007 Califarnia Fire.Code-is herebyamended {o read.as fouows Powered
industrial trucks shall be listed and labeled for use in the environment intended-and shall be in

accordance with nationally recognized atandards.

Maintenance of Protected Aboveground Tanks
Section 3404.2.7.3.5.4 of the 2007. California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:
Protected aboveground tanks and connected piping shall be maintained-in a safe operating.
condition. Protected abovegraund tanks. shall be.maintained in accordance with their listings.
Damage to protected aboveground tanks shall be repaired using material having equal or greater
sirength and fire resistanceror the: pratected. abovegeound tank shall Bereplaced or taken out of
service.

11



U1l/31/7ZUU% 1HU 1010/

FAX

Fire Apparatus Access Roads (Appendix D)
Appendix D Table D103.4 is.amended as foliows:
Requirements for Dead-End Fire Apparatus Access Roads

@orzs012

Length Width. Turnarounds Required
(feet) (feet)

0-150 20 None Required
151-500 20 100-foet hammerhead or 100 foot cul-de-sac
501-750 26 100-foot hammerhead or 100 foot cul-de-sac
Over 750 ' Special Approval Required

Appendix D Figure D103.1 is amended as follows:

Dead-End Fire Apparatus Access Road Turnaround

MINIMUM CLEARANCE
ARQUNDAFIRE - -
© HYDRANT

oy 2

1007 HAMMERHEAD

Mota: Drawing not o scale.

ioo” DIAMETER
CUL-DE<SAC

30R
TYP'

L I *
&2

5p7—>»4 100

W ¢

ACCEPTABLE ALTERNATIVE
TO 105 HAMMERHEAD -




HUGHSON FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
ORDINANCE NO. 2008-1

ORDINANCE FOR ADOPTION OF
THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
AND PROVIDING FOR THE MODIFICATION THEREOF

An ordinance of the Hughson Fire Protection District adopting the 2007 edition of the California
Fire Code, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion
hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and
devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and
premises in the Hughson Fire Protection District; providing for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees therefore; and repealing Ordinance No. 2 of the Hughson Fire Protection District
and all other District ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith.

The Board of Commissioners of the Hughson Fire Protection District does ordain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, one (1) copy of which is on file in the office of the Hughson
Fire Protection District, being marked and designated as the California Fire Code, 2007 edition,
including Appendix Chapters 1 and 4, Appendices A, B, C, D, E, F, G, and H as published by the
International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the Hughson Fire
Protection District, in the State of California regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and
property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous
substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the
occupancy of buildings and premises as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions
and terms of said Fire Code on file in the office of the Hughson Fire Protection District are hereby
referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the
additions, insertion, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance.

Section 2. That the following sections of Appendix Chapter 1 are hereby revised:

Section 101.1 Title These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the Hughson
Fire Protection District, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

Section 109.3. Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code,
shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter,
repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the
fire code official, or of a permit of certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be
guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than $1,000 dollars or by
imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that

a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate
offense.

Section 114.4 Failure to Comply Any person who shall continue any work after having
been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to

perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less that
$500 dollars or more than $ 1,000 doliars.

Section 3. That the Findings and Adoption of the 2007 California Fire Code, which is attached
hereto is incorporated by this reference.




Section 3204.3.1.1 All R-1, R-2, and R-3 zoning designations as identified by Chapter 21
of the Stanislaus County Code or Title 17 of the Hughson Municipal Code, as applicable.

Section 3404.2.9.5.1 All R-1, R-2, and R-3 zoning designations as identified by the

Chapter 21 of the Stanislaus County Code or Title 17 of the Hughson Municipal Code, as
applicable.

Section 3406.2.4.4 All R-1, R-2, and R-3 zoning designations as identified by Chapter 21
of the Stanislaus County Code or Title 17 of the Hughson Municipal Code, as applicable.

Section 3804.2 The incorporated boundary within the Hughson Fire Protection District.

Section 5. That Ordinance No. 2 of the Hughson Fire Protection District entitted AN ORDINANCE
ADOPTING THE 1998 CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, TITLE 24, PART 9,
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE (WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS) AND BY REFERENCE, THE
UNIFORM FIRE CODE, 1997 EDITION, AND THE UNIFORM FIRE CODE STANDARDS, 1997
EDITION PRESCRIBING REGULATIONS GOVERNING CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE
AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE, HAZARDOUS MATERIALS OR EXPLOSION AND PROVIDING
FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS FOR HAZARDOUS USES OR OPERATION and ail other
District ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 6. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, for any
reason, held to be invalid or unenforceable, such decision shall not affect the validity of the
remaining portions of this ordinance. The Board of Directors hereby declares that it would have
passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the

fact that any one or more section, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared
invalid or unenforceable.

Section 7. That nothing in this ordinance or in the Fire Code hereby adopted shall be construed to
affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or
any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as
cited in Section 5 of this ordinance; nor shall any just or iegal right or remedy of any character be
lost, impaired or affected by this ordinance.

Section 8. That the Hughson Fire Protection District is hereby ordered and directed to cause this
ordinance to be published.

Section 9. That this ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and
matters established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect after its
ratification by the Stanislaus County Board of Supervisors and the City Council of the City of
Hughson as required by California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7(c).

APPROVED by the Board of Directors of the Hughson Fire Protection District at a special meeting
thereof duly held on February 1, 2008, by the following vote:

AYES: Directors VILLARREAL, CAMAGNA and VOSS
NOES: None
ABSENT: Director HUMPHREYS

/s/ Kevin Voss
President of the Board




ATTEST:

/s/ Jon Galt

Secretary




Findings and Adoption of the 2007 California Fire Code

The Board of Supervisors hereby finds and determines: That the International Code Council is a
private organization, which has been in existence for at least three (3) years. That the California
Fire Code, 2007 Edition, and 2007 California Fire Code Standards, published by said organization,
are nationally recognized compilation of proposed rules, regulations, and standards of said
organization. That said 2007 California Fire Code and Fire Code Standards have been printed and
published as a code in book form within the meaning of Section 50022.2 et seq., of the
Government Code. That one (1) copy of the 2007 California Fire Code and one (1) copy of the
International Fire Code Standards, certified by the Clerk to be true copies, have been filed for use
and examination by the public in the office of the Clerk. That the sections of said 2007 California
Fire Code and California Fire Code Standards may be referred to by the number used in said
published compilation, preceded by the words “California Fire Code Section,” “Fire Code Section,”
or “California Fire Code Section” and may also be referred to by additional reference to Municipal
Code and sections therein pertaining to said 2007 California Fire Code and Fire Code Standards.
That the additional requirements and standards established herein are needed to properly protect
the heaith, safety, and welfare of the existing and future residents and workers of the Hughson Fire
Protection District. Said requirements and standards are reasonably necessary because of local
climatic, geological, and topographical conditions, and comply with existing state laws and
regulations.

Amendment of the 2007 California Fire Code is necessary so as to provide more stringent
standards for fire extinguishing systems, fire hazard and hazardous materials controls is necessary
to serve the public interest by reducing the risk to life and property of the citizens of Hughson Fire
Protection District because of the following local conditions:

(a) Summer weather conditions are very dry, hot and windy causing ordinary combustibles to be
easily ignited and fires to be fast spreading;

(b) Very dense fog conditions occur in winter. Reduced visibility causes delays in fire response;,

(c) Fire response is delayed by railroad tracks THEREFORE, for the above reasons taken
individually and cumulatively and in accordance with the authority granted in Sections 17958.5 and
17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code, the Council of the Hughson Fire Protection
District expressly finds there are local climatic and topographical conditions that make the
increased fire protection requirements set forth in this article reasonably necessary.

Appeals

Section 108.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code, Appendix Chapter 1- Administration is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Applicant may appeal the decision of the Chief to the Hughson Fire Protection District within thirty
(30) days from the date of the decision being appealed whenever the Chief:

1. Disapproves an application for use of alternate materials, methods and/or types of construction,
2. Disapproves an application for permit or refuses to grant a permit applied for,

3. When it is claimed that the provisions of the code do not apply, or

4. That the true intent and meaning of the code have been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted.



Compliance with Orders, Notices and Tags

Section 109.2.2 of the 2007 California Fire Code Appendix Chapter 1 - Administration is
hereby amended to read as follows:

Criminal Violations. It shall be unlawful for any person to violate any provision or to fail to
comply with any of the requirements of this chapter. A violation of any of the provisions or
failing to comply with any of the mandatory requirements of this chapter shall constitute a
misdemeanor; except that notwithstanding any other provision of this code, any such
violation constituting a misdemeanor under this code may, in the discretion of the Hughson
Fire Protection District Attorney, be charged and prosecuted as an infraction. Any person
convicted of a misdemeanor under the provisions of this chapter, unless provision is
otherwise herein made, shali be punishable by a fine of not more than one thousand
dollars ($1,000.00) or by imprisonment in the county jail for a period of not more than six
(6) months or by both fine and imprisonment. Any person convicted of an infraction under
the provisions of this code, unless provision is otherwise herein made, shall be punishable
by a fine only as follows: Upon a first conviction, by a fine of not exceeding two hundred
fifty dollars ($250.00) and for a second conviction or any subsequent conviction within a
period of one year, by a fine of not exceeding five hundred dollars ($500.00).

Each such person shall be charged with a separate offense for each and every day during
any portion of which any violation of any provision of this code is committed, continued or
permitted by such person and shall, upon conviction, be punished accordingly.

Administrative Penalties

In addition to any other remedies set forth in this chapter, administrative penalties may be
imposed against any person, as defined in Section 109.3 of this Code, for violating any of
the requirements set forth in this chapter. Any administrative penalties assessed shali be
as follows:

(a) For violations of this Code, Possession, Sale, Use or Discharge of Dangerous
Fireworks, the administrative penalty shall be five hundred dollars ($500.00) for each
specific act found to be in violation of that section.

(b) For ali violations of this chapter, Possession, Sale, Use or Discharge of Dangerous
Fireworks, the amount of the administrative penalty shall be one hundred dollars ($100.00)
for the first violation, two hundred doliars ($200.00) for a second violation within any twelve
(12) month period and five hundred dollars ($500.00) for any subsequent violations within
any twelve (12) month period.

Permit Required for Certain Operations

2007 California Fire Code Appendix Chapter 1- Administration is hereby amended to read
as follows:

Sections 105.6.15, 105.6.19, and 105.6.30 are hereby deleted.

Fees

(a)Permit Fee. The Board of the Hughson Fire Protection District may, by resolution
adopted from time to time, establish a fee for any permit issued pursuant to the Fire Code.
(b) Plan Check Fee. When a plan is required to be submitted the plan-checking fee shall be
paid at the time of submitting plans and specifications for checking.

Where plans are incomplete, or changed so as to require an additional plan check, an
additional plan-check fee shall be charged at a rate shown in a schedule setting forth fees
as adopted from time to time by resolution of the Hughson Fire Protection District.




Water Supplies and Fire Hydrants

Section 508.5.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
Required Water Supply for fire protection. An approved water supply capable of
supplying the required fire flow for fire protection shall be provided to premises upon which
facilities, buildings or portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or moved into or within
the jurisdiction. When any portion of the facility or building protected is in excess of 150
feet (45 720 mm) from a water supply on a public street, as measured by an approved
route around the exterior of the faculty or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains capable
of supplying the required fire flow shall be provided when required by the chief.

Fire hydrants shall be located on the supply side of the fire suppression system check
valve.

Fire hydrants shall be accessible to the Fire Department apparatus by roads meeting the
requirements of Section 503.1.

Fire Extinguishing Systems Chapter 9 is amended as follows
903.2.1.1 (A-1 Occupancy) Amend as follows:
1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).
903.2.1.2 (A-2 Occupancy) Amend as follows:
1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).
903.2.1.3 (A-3 Occupancy) Amend as follows:
1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).
903.2.1.4 (A4 Occupancy) Amend as follows:
1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).
903.2.2 (E Occupancy) Amend as follows:
1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).
903.2.3 (F-1 Occupancy) Amend as follows:
1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).
903.2.6 (M Occupancy) Amend as follows:
1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).
903.2.7 (R Occupancy) Amend as follows:
1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).
2. Al residential structures containing 5 or more dwelling units under a single roof.

3. For buildings and structures classified as R-3 occupancies, the square footage

of the structures shall include garages and all other enclosed spaces under
one roof. Garages that share at least one common wall, roof or attic with the
dwelling shall be considered under the same roof as the dwelling and shall be
provided with automatic fire sprinklers when required by this chapter.

903.2.7.1 (R Occupancy) Amend to read as follows:
Buildings 30 feet or 3 stories in height. An automatic fire sprinkier system shall

be installed throughout buildings with a floor level that is located 30 feet (9.144 m)

or more above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access or 3 or more
stories in height.

903.2.7.2 (R Occupancy) Add to read:

Cluster homes will be defined as a community of three or more buildings or structures over
120 square feet (11 m?) in area, with a single point of fire truck access, when the access is




less than 30 feet ( 9 m) in width. Constructed of lightweight building materials spaced ten
feet or less apart. The construction is Type 5, in which walls, beams, girders, trusses and
roofs are made of dimensional lumber. They have narrow travel lanes separating each
occupancy.

903.2.7.3. (R Occupancy) Add to read:

Any building on plot sizes less than 5000 square feet.
903.2.8 (S-1 Occupancy) Amend as follows:

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).
903.2.8.1 (Repair Garages) Amend as follows:

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).

903.2.10.4 (B Occupancy). Add to read:
An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all buildings:
1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).

903.2.18 (U Occupancy). Amend as follows:

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet (465 m?).

EXCEPTION:
1. Non-residential buildings and unoccupied structures that are located in

Agricultural zones and permitted by the planning Department under Code Section
21.20.020(A) .

903.2.18 Existing Buildings and Structures. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system
shall be installed in all existing buildings and structures when additions, alterations, or
repairs are made within any twelve-month period that exceed fifty (50) percent of the total
value (current county assessed valuation or valuation determined by a certified real estate
appraiser) of an existing building or structure that exceeds five thousand (5,000) square
feet (total floor area under roof) or which result in said building or structure exceeding five
thousand (5,000) square feet (total floor area under roof).

EXCEPTION:
1. Non-residential buildings and structures that are located in Agricultural zones
and permitted by the planning Department under Code Section 21.20.020(A)

All buildings and structures classifies as R-3 or U occupancies.

Each portion of an existing building or structure separated by one or more area
separation walls, constructed in accordance with the current adopted edition of

the Building Code, when each portion does not exceed five thousand (5,000)
square feet.

Existing buildings or structures and their addition(s) are exempt from automatic
sprinklers when the cost of the remodel of the existing building(s) or
structures(s) is less than fifty (50) percent of the value (current county
assessed valuation for improvements) of the buildings or structures, and
sprinklers are permitted to be omitted from the addition(s), due to type of
construction, use, or other special situations, by the California Fire Code or
National Fire Protection Association Standard 13.

903.2.18.1 For isolated buildings or groups of buildings (meeting the requirements of
subsection 6 or 7 in rural area where no water is available from a municipal water system,




a fire sprinkler system meeting all of the following criteria shall be considered as an
alternative to systems that are in full compliance with the applicable NFPA Standard.

1. Sprinklers will be designed and installed per the applicable NFPA Standards

2. The required sprinkler demand (not including hose stream allowance) shall be
provided by a hydro pneumatic tank for a minimum duration of 15 minutes. The
Tank may be pressurized by the domestic well pump and may serve both the fire
supply and domestic supply for the building. The tank must have a capacity equal
to or greater than the calculated sprinkler demand. Calculations shali be provided
to determine the actual size of tank required for each project.

3. A separate storage tank or other water source acceptable to the chief shall be

provided to accommodate sprinkler and hose demand for an additional 30 minutes
beyond the storage required in 8(b).

4. An Approved sprinkler system monitoring alarm as defined in section 1003.3.1
of the Stanislaus County Fire Code shall be provided.

EXCEPTION: Buildings and structures classified as R-3 are exempt from the
storage tank requirements of 8(c).

Fire Alarm Systems

Section 907.1.5 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended by adding the

following:

A certificate from Underwriters Laboratories (UL) shall be required on all commercial fire
alarm systems installed after the effective date of this ordinance. UL certification is required

to be maintained for commercial fire alarm systems throughout the life of the alarmed building.

Open Burning
Section 307.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended by adding the following:

Open burning. No person shall kindle, conduct, or maintain any buming of grass, weeds,
agricultural trimmings, or other combustibles or authorize any such fire to be kindled,
conducted, or maintained without a permit as required by the San Joaquin Valley Unified
Air Pollution Control District and compliance with all safeguards pursuant thereto. Any such
permitted burning shall be restricted to agricuitural purposes and confined to areas of the
Keyes Fire Protection District in which agricultural uses are lawful.

Type of Lock or Latch for Premises Where Gold or Bullion is Traded (NOTE:
Building Code)
Section 1008.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is amended to add subsection 10 as
follows:
Special Latching Devices An exit door from a business which has as its primary
commercial activity the sale, resale, exchange, or trade of gold or silver coin, bullion, or
metal ore may be equipped with a locking mechanism which is not able open from inside
without the use of a key or which requires special knowledge or effort so long as all of the
following conditions are met during all times that the business is open to the public:
1. The locking mechanism is connected to a smoke detector system in such a manner that
activation or malfunction of the smoke detector system results in automatically unlocking
the exit door;
2. The locking mechanism is connected to the electrical power supply for the building in
such a manner that any loss of electrical power to the building results in automaticaily




unlocking the exit door; '

3. Two (2) employees must be within the area of the premises used for retail purposes,
including adjacent service and utility rooms, at all times; and

4. A sign is permanently posted upon the premises so as to be readily seen by any person

or persons entering the business stating that the management electronically controls
ingress and egress.

False Alarms

Section 405.10 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
False alarms shall not be given, signaled or transmitted or caused or permitted to be given,
signaled or transmitted. The Hughson Fire Protection District may adopt by resolution

reasonable fees to recover the costs associated with responses to building or structures
that have excessive false alarms.

Hot Works

Section 2604.2.6 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to add the following:
When required by the Chief a minimum 2-A: 20B: C-rated fire extinguisher shall be
mounted to each portable welding cart.

Fireworks

See Stanislaus County Code Chapter 9.84 Fireworks

Restricted Locations of Flammable and Combustible Liquids in Tanks

Section 3404.2.9.5.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Storage of Class | and Hi Liquids in aboveground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited,
with the exception of protected tanks designed, installed and maintained in accordance
with the 2007 California Fire Code. The provisions of this section shall not apply to facilities
for the production, generation, or transmission of electric energy that provide power to
entities furnishing retail electrical services to the general public within the Hughson Fire
Protection District.

Operating Heating, Lighting, and Cooking Appliances Prohibited

Section 3405.3.3 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to include the
following:

Class Il and lll Liquids

Location of Bulk Plants for Storage of Flammable and Combustible Liquids

Section 3406.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
The construction of new bulk plants for storage of flammable or combustible liquids is
restricted to areas of the Hughson Fire Protection District zoned Heavy Industrial Zones. All
existing nonconforming bulk plants for storage of flammable or combustible liquids, which

substantially comply with the requirements of this Code, may be continued in use if the
Chief grants a permit.




Transfer Operations

Section 3406.5.1.1 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended by adding to the
following:

Tank vehicles and tank cars shall be unloaded as soon as possible after arrival at point of
delivery and shall not be used as storage tanks. Unless otherwise approved, a tank car
shall not be allowed to remain on a siding at the point of delivery for more than twenty-four
(24) hours while connected for transfer operations.

Hazardous Materials Permits

Subsection 3 is added to Section 2701.5 of the 2007 California Fire Code:

Key Box. When required by the Chief, an approved key box, sized to contain emergency
information, shall be provided.

Deposits of Hazardous Materials; Cleanup, Abatement, or Mitigation
Required; Liability for Costs

Section 2703.3.1.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Responsibility for cleanup The person, firm or corporation responsible for an
unauthorized discharge shall institute and complete all actions necessary to remedy the
effects of such unauthorized discharge, whether sudden or gradual, at no cost to the
jurisdiction. When deemed necessary by the Chief, cleanup may be initiated by the Fire
Department or by an authorized individual or firm. Costs associated with such cleanup shall
be born by the owner, operator or other person responsible for the unauthorized discharge.
The remedy provided by this section shall be in addition to any other remedies provided by
law.

For purposes of this section, costs incurred by the Hughson Fire Protection District shall
include, but shall not necessarily be limited to, the following: actual labor costs of Hughson
Fire Protection District personnel, including worker's compensation benefits, fringe benefits,
administrative overhead; cost of equipment operation; cost of materials obtained directly by
the Hughson Fire Protection District; and cost of any contract labor and materials. The
authority to recover costs under this section shall not include actual fire suppression services
that are normally or usually provided by the Fire Department.

General Safety Precautions
Section 312.2 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Protection from vehicles: Guard posts or other approved means shall be provided to
protect storage tanks and connected piping, valves and fittings; dispensing areas; and use
areas subject to vehicular damage. When guard posts are installed, the posts shall be:

1. Constructed of stesel not less than six (6) inches in diameter and concrete filled,

2. Spaced not more than four (4) feet between posts on center,

3. Set not less than three (3) feet deep in a concrete footing of not less than a fifteen (15)
inch diameter, ;

4. Set with the top of the posts not less than three (3) feet above ground, and

5. Located not less than five (5) feet from the tank.

Outside Storage and Use of Liquefied Petroleum Gases

Section 3804.2 of the 2007 California Fire Code is amended as follows:

The outside storage of liquefied petroleum gas (LP-gas) shall conform to the provisions of
Stanislaus County zoning ordinances. The outside storage and use of liquefied petroleum
gases is restricted as specified in this section.




1. Storage and dispensing of LP-gas for resale purposes, into approved containers and
vehicles, is restricted to those areas of the Stanisiaus County zoned as Commercial-Light
industrial, Heavy Industrial, and, in addition thereto, to other commercially zoned properties
used as automotive service stations. Only qualified persons shall perform dispensing.

2. Dispensing of LP-gas for private use is restricted to those zones identified in subsection
1, and when approved by the Chief, may be permitted in those areas of the Stanislaus
County zoned General Commercial. Only qualified persons shall perform dispensing.

3. For cooking, lighting, or heating in a building, only on a property that does not have
natural gas service existing on a boundary line of said property or when prohibition of such
storage would cause undue hardship.

4. For temporary use on construction sites, when authorized by the Chief.

5. For use as an alternative fuel supply for an emergency standby generator, when
authorized by the Chief.

6. For use with certain mobile vending and certain commercial barbecue equipment and
other specific uses when authorized by the Chief.

7. For use by Artisans in pursuit of their trade, when authorized by the Chief.

8. Storage of portable containers awaiting exchange may be permitted in commercially
zoned areas of the Stanislaus County, including those zoned Neighborhood Commercial,
when approved by the Chief and stored in accordance with Section 3809. Such storage
shall be located a minimum of twenty (20) feet from any fuel dispenser.

9. Containers that exceed 2,000 gallons shall comply with procedure FPB 82-01

Permmits and Plans for Liquefied Petroleum Gases
Section 3801.2 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Permits. Permits shall be required as set forth in Appendix Chapter1, Sections 105.6 and
105.7

EXCEPTION:
1. Containers not exceeding five (5) gallon water capacity, used for “barbecue”
cooking, when used and stored outside of buildings.
2, Approved containers not exceeding sixteen and four-tenths (16.4) ounces when
displayed for sale in mercantile occupancies.
3. Factory installed containers for recreational vehicles not exceeding ten (10)
gallon water capacity.
4. Factory installed tanks that are permanently attached to recreational vehicles.
Distributors shall not fill an LP-gas container for which a permit is required unless the fire
code official has issued a permit for installation for that location.

Supervision and Communication System
Section 907.2.1.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:
Supervision. Places of assembly shall be under the constant supervision of a competent
aduit on the premises during the time that the premises are open to the public.
Communications. When required by the chief, places of assembly shall be provided with
a method for notifying the fire department in the event of an emergency. Such method can
consist of a telephone, an alarm system connected to the fire department or other

approved agency, or other approved means. Methods of notifying the fire department shall
department shall be readily available to the public.

Powered Industrial Truck Operation
Section 309.7 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
Powered Industrial trucks shall be listed and labeled for use in the environment intended
and shall be in accordance with nationally recognized standards.




Maintenance of Protected Aboveground Tanks
Section 3404.2.7.3.5.4 of the 2007 California Fire Code is hereby added to read as
follows: Protected aboveground tanks and connected piping shall be maintained in a safe
operating condition. Protected aboveground tanks shall be maintained in accordance with
their listings. Damage to protected aboveground tanks shall be repaired using material
having equal or greater strength and fire resistance or the protected aboveground tank
shall be replaced or taken out of service.




Fire Apparatus Access Roads (Appendix D)
Appendix D Table D103.4 is amended as follows:
Requirements for Dead-End Fire Apparatus Access Roads

o |
0  [00-foot hammerhead or 100 foot cul-de-sac
6 |

00-foot hammerhead or 100 foot cul-de-sac

Special Approval Required

150

‘4 m_
S
Sa

Appendix D Figure D103.1 is amended as follows:
Dead-End Fire Apparatus Access Road Turnaround




MINIMUM CLEARANCE
. AROUND A EIRE

HYDRANT
! ~~ 100
50—} r:::zo’
30'R
TYP.!
| e 8

100" HAMMERHEAD

Note: Drawing not to scale.

100"
R50’
30° R
TYP
20”
100" DIAMETER
CUL-DE-SAC
T.-
100”7
P S
ACCEPTABLE ALTERNATIVE

TO 100 HAMMERHEAD




